

# DSK Law

de Beaubien · Simmons · Knight · Mantzaris · Neal

EST. 1976

Post Office Box 87  
332 North Magnolia Avenue  
Orlando, Florida 32802  
Phone: 407-422-2454  
Tax ID No. 59-2206392  
www.dsklawgroup.com

REC'D COUNTY ATTORNEY  
JUL 21 2025 10:01 AM

Charlotte County Internal Investigation  
18500 Murdock Circle  
Port Charlotte, FL 33948

July 16, 2025  
Invoice # 526842

For Legal Services Rendered Through 06/30/25

Re: 062932 Charlotte County Internal Investigation

Date	Atty	Description	Hours	Amount
06/01/25	LNG	Reviewed materials and County policies	1.00	350.00
06/02/25	LNG	Investigation Report	0.40	140.00
06/02/25	LNG	Telephone conference with J. Knowlton	0.40	140.00
06/05/25	LNG	Emailed Mr. Aguirre re: Charlotte Investigation into Commissioner Constance	0.20	70.00
06/06/25	JYW	Prepare and email secure document folder RE: Charlotte Investigation (CC) - Charlotte County	0.20	20.00
06/06/25	JYW	Telephone conversations with Mr. Aguirre & DSK IT and email communication to DSK IT KA re SENSITIVE AND ATTORNEY CLIENT PRIVILEGE - RE: Charlotte Investigation - Data Extraction	0.40	40.00
06/06/25	JYW	Review of upload progression re secure document folder - Charlotte Investigation (CC) - Charlotte County	0.50	50.00
06/08/25	LNG	Receive and review emails RE: SENSITIVE AND ATTORNEY CLIENT PRIVILEGE - RE: Charlotte Investigation - Data Extraction	0.50	175.00
06/09/25	JYW	Update regarding upload - SENSITIVE AND ATTORNEY CLIENT PRIVILEGE - RE: Charlotte Investigation - Data Extraction	0.20	20.00

**de Beaubien, Simmons, Knight, Mantzaris & Neal LLP**

Client Ref: CHARCO - 062932  
 Invoice # 526842

July 16, 2025  
 Page 2

<b>Date</b>	<b>Atty</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
06/12/25	JYW	Email communication from and to client re Upload status of files re Charlotte Investigation - Charlotte County	0.30	30.00
06/12/25	JYW	Coordination of Review RE: Charlotte Investigation - Charlotte County	0.10	10.00
06/14/25	LNG	Review thousands of photos, several videos, documents, etc purported to be from Commissioner Constance's laptop	6.30	2,205.00
06/16/25	JYW	Confirmation of Review TC w/LNG RE: Charlotte County Investigation	0.20	20.00
06/17/25	JYW	Telephone conference with Jennette Knowlton re if a court reporter will be utilized during interviews with transcripts available - Charlotte County	0.10	10.00
06/19/25	JYW	Clarification re court reporter to LNG RE: Coordination of Review RE: Charlotte Investigation	0.10	10.00
06/25/25	LNG	Prepare for interview with Mr. Aguirre	0.80	280.00
06/26/25	JYW	Scheduled and confirmed Court reporter for 06-26-25 Investigation Call at 10 AM via conference call - Charlotte County Investigations	0.30	30.00
06/26/25	LNG	Prepare for and conduct interview of Anthony Aguirre	2.20	770.00
06/28/25	LNG	Email to JW RE: Charlotte Investigation Folder Link	0.40	140.00
06/30/25	JYW	Commissioner Constance's interview with Attorney Greene - Charlotte County Investigations	0.30	30.00

**Summary of Services**

		<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Amount</b>
LNG	Lindsay N Greene - Partner	350.00	12.20	4,270.00
JYW	Jacquee Williamson - Paralegal	100.00	2.70	270.00
<b>Total Fees</b>			<b>14.90</b>	<b>\$4,540.00</b>

**de Beaubien, Simmons, Knight, Mantzaris & Neal LLP**

Client Ref: CHARCO - 062932  
Invoice # 526842

July 16, 2025  
Page 3

<b>Current Due</b>	<u><u>\$4,540.00</u></u>
Previous Balance	7,642.70
Payments Since Last Bill	-7,642.70
<b>Total Due</b>	<u><u>\$4,540.00</u></u>

All Invoices Due Upon Receipt. Balance Subject to 12% Finance Charge.

Our Federal Tax ID #: 59-2206392

**APPROVED FOR PAYMENT**  
*Janette S. Kurwath*  
County Attorney  
\_\_\_\_\_  
ACA  
LR 25-0553  
2025  
Date