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Stonecast Vinyl Plank Flooring
6 Colors in Stock

Vinyl Windows   25 Sizes in Stock

Sq.Ft.

• Lumber/OSB/Plywood/Trusses
• Siding/Windows/Doors
• Treated or Composite Decking
• Custom Kitchens/Baths
• Shingles and Steel Roofing
JUST A FEW OF THE THINGS
YOU’LL FIND IN OUR STORE!

Celebrating 67 Years!  Since 1958

www.tionestabuilders.us
EMAIL: tbs@penn.com

Shippenville
814-226-5040

Tionesta
814-755-3561

•  Made in the USA

•  More than 65 Classically

Elegant Finish Options

•  Standard All Plywood

Construction!
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Available sizes: 36”x72” or 36”x93” and 60”x72”

Check out Special order
Quick Ship Program$149.95
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More than 
30 in stock!
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From $86.99$86.99

15 Lines • 25 Colors Available
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40 & 45 Year Warranty
29 Gauge - 23 Colors

2 Day Ship Time

Per Sq. ft.

In  Stock

In Stock In Tionesta

20% OFF!

Licensed RealTree Products

KraftMaid Custom 
Kitchen & Bath

Cabinets for the real living room
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BRIGGS WHOLE
HOME GENERATORS

In Stock and Ready to Rock!!

Tionesta Builders Supply has a wealth of experience unique in this day and age

Submitted photo.
Cory Schmader speaks with his children Sophia and Harrison about veneer stone

options. Sophia and Harrison are working at the store as summer help. 

Submitted article

TIONESTA – Tion-
esta Builders Sup-
ply is worth the
trip to Tionesta or

shop in your back yard in
Shippenville.
History

From small beginnings
in 1958 to big aspirations
in 2025.  A lot has changed
in the Home Improvement
landscape over the last 67

years.  In case you didn’t
know, TIONESTA
BUILDERS SUPPLY is a
family owned and operated
home improvement center
in business since 1958.
They have two stores to
serve the community bet-
ter, including four genera-
tions of the Schmader fam-
ily contributing since the
beginning. 

The main “Home
Improvement Center” in

Tionesta first opened in
1958 by Dennis Schmader.
In 1981 the Shippenville
location opened.  Garry
and Larry Schmader (Den-
nis’ sons) welcomed their
sons into the business
more than 30 years ago.
And don’t forget Garry and
Larry have been doing this
for over 60 years too!
Today two grandchildren
have been working part-
time while in school, mak-

ing them the fourth gener-
ation to work for the com-
pany.  

Keeping up with the
latest trends is a full time
job that we are more than
happy to take on.   We’re
full of great ideas!  New
product lines, old product
lines, updated displays and
a large inventory are cor-
nerstones to having what
the customer needs when
they walk through our

doors.  We are constantly
updating our displays to
keep up with popular
trends in the building and
remodeling industry.  

“Having two Home
Improvement Centers is
convenient for our cus-
tomers.  If we don’t have
something at one store
we’ll have it the next day
from our other store.  Our
Tionesta store has 12
warehouses.  That’s the

advantage to having a
large diverse inventory,”
Kristian Schmader said.

Open six days a week:
Monday thru Friday 8 a.m.
to 5 p.m. and Saturday 8
a.m. to noon and we are
open 24/7 online!

The phone number for
the Tionesta store is 814-
755-3561 and the Ship-
penville store’s number is
814-226-5040.
See TIONESTA BUILDERS, Page 6

Submitted photo.
Brothers:  Kyle, Kristian and Keane Schmader talk about kitchen and bath design

options.
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Leading the Future of Community Health: A
Q&A with UPMC Northwest’s New President

814-226-7332

South Fifth Ave. 
CLARION

Monday - Friday 9-5 
Closed Saturday and Sunday

www.clarioncarpetbarn.com

Proudly serving Clarion area for 
54 Years!

Thank you to our loyal customers!
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Jonathan Bailey

Submitted article
SENECA — UPMC

Northwest welcomed
Jonathan Bailey as its new
president in June. Bailey
served as vice president of
Operations at UPMC
Northwest since June of
2022. He graduated from
Slippery Rock University
with a bachelor’s degree in
exercise science and
received a master’s degree
in business administration
from Point Park University
in Pittsburgh.

Former president Brian
Durniok serves as the pres-
ident of UPMC Hamot and
market president, North-
west Pa. and Western New
York. 

Meet Jonathan Bai-
ley, President, UPMC
Northwest

Q: How long have you
been at UPMC North-
west? Where were you
prior?

A: I’ve been at UPMC
Northwest for three years,
starting as the vice presi-
dent of Operations. Prior to
this, I worked at UPMC
Horizon in Farrell and
Greenville and UPMC
Jameson in New Castle in
various leadership roles. I
started my career at
UPMC in 1999. 

Q: Can you share a
pivotal moment in your
career that prepared
you for this position?

A: The COVID-19 pan-
demic was a pivotal
moment for all the hospi-
tals in the country. I had
the opportunity to lead a
variety of departments as
we responded to the pan-
demic at UPMC. It trans-
formed the way healthcare
was delivered and how we
managed day-to-day activi-
ties. 

During the pandemic,
telemedicine became very
important. Throughout
UPMC, the use of telemed-
icine increased significant-
ly, as much as 300 percent
since the start of the pan-
demic. Today, UPMC
Northwest continues to
offer the largest tele-health
program in the UPMC sys-
tem with 40 out-patient
specialty programs and 10
in-patient programs.

Personally, I learned the
importance of resiliency
and collaboration during
that time. I hope to contin-

ue to guide my actions as a
leader with the best prac-
tices we developed as part
of our pandemic response.

Q: What does the job
of the president entail
at UPMC Northwest?

A: My role as president
is to ensure that the hospi-
tal delivers high quality
health care to our commu-
nity, while also navigating
the challenges and com-
plexity of the industry. 

Q: What do you like
to do in your spare
time?

A: I have two high
school age children who are
very active in sports and
theater, so my time is often
spent supporting their
activities. Besides that, I
like to travel with my fam-
ily and jog. I participate in
a couple foot races a year,
whether it’s 10 miles or a
half marathon.

Q: What are some of
your goals as president?

A: My goals are three
pronged: access, safety, and
experience. We want to
ensure our patients can
rely on us for high-quality
close to home care with
exceptional experience for
our employees and
patients. 

Q: What makes
UPMC Northwest
unique?

A: UPMC Northwest is
unique for many reasons.
Most importantly, we are a
community hospital dedi-
cated to serving our county.
We have the resources we
need to provide care to our
patients locally, with the
support of a large integrat-
ed health system. 

Being part of a 40-hos-
pital academic medical
center continues to help in
our overall management of
operations. We share
resources, transfer
patients, have access to a
variety of experts, and
secure the appropriate
equipment and technolo-
gies to keep our staff and
patients safe.

Q: What opportuni-
ties do people have at
UPMC that they may
not have in other
places?

A: Our staff have the
opportunity to work in a
community setting with all
the advanced technologies
that UPMC provides. Our

staff can grow with the
resources UPMC provides,
whether it’s through career
ladder advancement at
their local hospitals or
opportunities at other hos-
pitals. 

Q: What role does
UPMC Northwest’s com-
mitment to investing in
the community play in
enhancing the region’s
well-being? 

A: We understand and
appreciate our role in pro-
viding community health
in the region, and we will
continue to be actively
involved in community
benefit activities. That
includes community health
fairs, screenings, educa-
tional events, and invest-
ing in healthcare employ-
ment opportunities
whenever we can offer
them. 

UPMC Northwest’s
annual economic impact to
the region is more than
$245 million. In Fiscal Year
2023, UPMC Northwest
provided $11 million in
benefits to the community,
including more than $7
million in free and
reduced-cost care to the
area’s most vulnerable citi-
zens.

Q: What are a few of
UPMC Northwest’s
biggest achievements in
2024 and 2025 thus far?

A: I am proud of our
recruitment, especially
with our nurses. In the first
three months of 2025, we
have retained all our nurs-
es with less than one year
of experience. 

In 2024, UPMC North-
west was awarded an Ener-
gy Star Certification,
which is a program run by
the Environmental Protec-
tion Agency (EPA) that
grants certification based
on strict energy perfor-
mance standards like elec-
tric, natural gas, and water
usage along with hospital
metrics. 

To achieve certification,
a building must maintain a
minimum score of 75 over a
year-long period. UPMC
Northwest scored 83 for
2022.  Over the past few
years, UPMC Northwest
has made major energy
management changes, fol-
lowing an ambitious sus-
tainability plan first devel-
oped in 2017. The plan

called for low cost retro
commissioning and deep
retrofit energy manage-
ment efforts that were ini-
tiated in 2018 with Envini-
ty, a sustainability-focused
commissioning and engi-
neering firm. 

We were recently recog-
nized by CMS with a five-
star rating for cleanliness
and for having zero cases of
MRSA. 

In October, 2024, we cel-
ebrated our 20th anniver-
sary as the first UPMC
hospital built from the
ground up. UPMC North-
west officially opened its
doors on Oct. 8, 2004. The
126-bed facility and 28-bed
behavioral health center
brought together the hospi-
tal’s two former locations
in Franklin and Oil City. 

The last 20 years at
UPMC Northwest have
been full of growth, and the
hospital continues to pro-
vide excellent care and ser-
vice to Venango, Clarion,
Forrest, Mercer, and Craw-
ford counties and beyond.  

Q: Which new
providers and staff
were you excited to
bring to UPMC North-
west?

A: We hired a handful of
doctors. Most notably, we
hired Francis Ogbolu, D.O.,
urology, and David
Thomas, D.O., general
surgery. 

We were also excited to
bring Kristen Maguire,
chief nursing officer,
UPMC Northwest, back to
UPMC as both our chief
nursing officer and vice
president of Patient Care
Services. She is an advo-
cate for all our nurses, pro-
moting a workplace where
staff are engaged, where
patients are getting the
exceptional care they
deserve, and where we are
strengthening the trust the
community has in UPMC
Northwest.

Q: How many babies
did UPMC Northwest
deliver in 2024 and 2025
thus far?

A: In 2024, we delivered
505 babies, and in 2025
thus far, we delivered 270.
Our delivery volumes have
increased by 50 through
the end of May, and we are
so proud of the work they
do to ensure the families in
our community receive the

best care possible. 
This year, they conduct-

ed an amniotic fluid
embolism (AFE) simula-
tion designed to mimic a
real-life event and to train
medical professionals to
test and develop their
skills and responses in a
controlled environment.
The multidisciplinary exer-
cise took place over a two-
day period and involved 60
staff members including
obstetricians, obstetric
nurses, and staff from
anesthesia, emergency
department, respiratory
therapy, pharmacy, lab and
blood bank. 

Q: What initiatives
will you be prioritizing
in the upcoming months
to enhance patient care
and services?

A: Now, we are focused
on the conversion of our
electronic medical record to
Epic, providing a single
EMR for both the hospital
and physician practices.
We are hopeful that this

project, named UPMC
Bridges, will enhance the
patient experience,
improve collaboration with
the offices and the hospital,
and provide better service
to our patients. 

Q: What are you look-
ing forward to for the
rest of the year?

A: For the remainder of
the year, I’m looking for-
ward to continuing to work
with the incredible team
and getting to know the
staff and our community
leaders better.

Q: How do you envi-
sion the future of UPMC
Northwest in the next
five years?

A: At UPMC Northwest,
we will continue to focus on
workforce development
and staff recruitment. We
will innovate and strive for
clinical excellence. We will
continue to invest in tech-
nology and infrastructure
to ensure we are providing
our community with top-
notch care.�

Clarion’s best kept
secret—The Liberty
House Restaurant
By David A. Hollis
CLARION NEWS Staff Writer

CLARION
Sometimes the best

things about a town are hid-
den in plain sight. The Liber-
ty House Restaurant is just
such a place. 

“I think that’s our biggest
challenge is that people don’t
realize we’re open to the pub-
lic,” said manager Roberta
S i m p s o n ,  
“You don’t need to be a mem-
ber to come in here.”

Located at 603 Liberty St
in Clarion inside the VFW
building, The Liberty House
Restaurant if a full-service
establishment offering cus-
tomers a wide range of appe-
tizer and meal options, with
alcohol available to card-car-
rying members. Simpson
added,

“The only time you would
have to show a card is if you
wanted an alcoholic drink
during your dinner. You or
somebody in your party has
to be a member.”

The restaurant offers a
classic menu from breakfast
to burgers, broasted chicken,
wings, fish, fries, salads and
baskets, an assortment of

beverage options and much
more. Simpson remarked, 

“We have daily specials,
we have a soup, salad and
dessert bar on Fridays. And
all of our soups are home-
made.”

Daily specials include the
“Poor Man’s Breakfast,”
which is one egg, two strips of
bacon or sausage and toast
for only $3.95, or the Liberty
House Burger with fries for
$12.95.

“We also do catering and
events like birthday parties,
weddings, anything like
that.”

Another noteworthy
event, Simpson added, is
their Veterans picnic on
August 16 at Clarion County
Park. 

“That’s a busy time for us
and it’s always a great
turnout.”

Hours are Tuesday
through Thursday, 8 a.m. to 2
p.m., Fridays at 8 a.m. to 8
p.m., Saturdays from 8 a.m.
to 2 p.m., and Sundays 8 a.m.
to noon. Closed Mondays.

Gift certificates are also
available. Follow The Liberty
House Restaurant on Face-
book for more information
and specials.�

Route 66 Sporting Goods has been
serving area for over three decades
Submitted article
PAINT TWP. — Route

66 Sporting Goods is look-
ing to celebrate their 21st
year in business under the
ownership of Linda and Lee
Dechant. Route 66 Sporting
Goods is located on State
Route Route 66, 1.5 miles
north of U.S. Route 322 in
Shippenville.

Route 66 Sporting
Goods employs a knowl-
edgeable staff including,
Lori Gadley, Mike Bev-
eridge, Mindy Maurer, Joe
Winger, Pam Bauer, and
Wayne Gadley. They pride
themselves on being able to
answer any question about
their vast selection of mer-
chandise for the great out-
doors. They will work one
on one with the customer to
give them the ultimate per-
sonal experience.

Route 66 Sporting
Goods has something to
meet the needs of all
hunters, fishermen, reload-
ers, campers, archers, and
trappers. They carry many
high quality brands and
are the largest retail trap-
ping supplier in Western
PA. 

New for 2025 are fur
buying events. Keith Win-
kler from Sterling Fur will
come in a few times and
year and pay cash for furs.
Check out the Facebook
page for updates.

Route 66 will also con-
tinue to host buck scoring
events throughout the year.

If there is something
they don’t have in stock,
Route 66 will order it in for
the customer. They also
offer layaway and gift cer-
tificates. 

They are always
expanding and adding to

their large inventory to bet-
ter suit the customer.

Their large archery sec-
tion is run by Lori Gadley,
daughter of Lee and Linda
Dechant, and Mike Bev-
eridge. Route 66 is the
areas Mathews Archery
Dealer. Besides Mathews,
Route 66 also carries Hoyt,
Bowtech, Tenpoint, Excal-
ibur, and Bear with all the
accessories to complement
the bows.

Route 66 carries recurve
accessories as well as carry-
ing a wide selection of
recurve and long bows. 

The archery section con-
tinues to include many
accessories including 3D
targets, arrows, sights,
range-finding sights and
much more. 

New for 2025 Route 66
is now stocking Mathews
Branded Ultra View sights!

Route 66 Sporting
Goods carries a vast selec-
tion of pistols, rifles, and
shotguns from the follow-
ing manufacturers: Brown-
ing, Weatherby, Ruger,
Bergara, Christensen,
Remington, Winchester,
Smith & Wesson, Mossberg,
Walther, Taurus, Savage,
Heritage, Sig Sauer, Kim-
ber and Beretta. They also
carry black powder equip-
ment. They have a fine
selection of Inline and
Flintlock rifles as well as
black powder pistols.

Flintlock rifles by Ped-
ersoli can be found in stock
year round.

Route 66 Sporting
Goods is now stocking
Bergara Carbon Fiber
Rifles as well as Chris-
tensen.

There are over/under
shotguns in stock year-

round by companies such
as: Franchi, CZ, Stoeger,
Browning, and Mossberg.
There are also Side by side
shotguns in stock too!

Route 66 Sporting
Goods stocks a vast selec-
tion of scopes by Leupold,
Bushnell, Hawke, and Vor-
tex. They also have an
extensive selection of bases
and rings by Weaver,
Leupold, Talley and Brown-
ing.

New for 2025 are
infrared and thermal
scopes and thermal hand-
helds.

Route 66 Sporting
Goods carries an extensive
selection of equipment for
any type of fishing includ-
ing fly fishing, fly tying, and
ice fishing. 

Route 66 has expanded
the Bass fishing selection!
Be sure to stop and check
out baits from Gary
Yamamoto, Z-Man, Strike
King, Bass Assassin,
Rapala, Fish Bio, and many
more!

The camping section is
always well stocked with
tents, Palmer (MADE IN
USA) cast iron pie irons,
flashlights, Coleman fuel &
propane, and so much
more.

The clothing section at
the store is stocked with
clothing by Under Armour,
Gamehide, Badlands, DSG
and Rocky. Route 66 also
has boots and shoes from
LaCrosse, Rocky, DSG, and
Muck boots.

New for the summer
Route 66 has the all new
Muckster Clog and ankle
boots! They are great for
slipping on and heading out
into the yard!

Route 66 also now

stocks snake gaitors and
snake boots.

You are also able to find
Badlands packs, and acces-
sories at Route 66.

Route 66 is also a Kene-
trek Boot dealer for Those
that Take the Trail Less
Traveled.

All Hunting and Fishing
License can be purchased
at Route 66 Sporting
Goods. Allegheny National
Forest ATV/OHM Trail per-
mits can also be purchased
at the store (only season
passes).

Did you know Route 66
has a canning section!? Be
sure to stop in and get your
lids, bands, and canners
made by Wisconsin Alu-
minum Foundry! Route 66
also has a large selection of
LEM grinders and acces-
sories, including the juicer
attachment and screens!
Along with the grinders
Route 66 has the MaxVac
sealers and New for 2025
the vacuum chambers as
well as the bags for all mod-
els!

The year 2024 proved to
be another interesting year
and we are thankful for all
of our customers continued
support. We at Route 66 are
always placing orders and
trying to get product in dur-
ing these crazy times.

Mark those calendars!
The Open house is Christ-
mas in July this year! July
25, 26, and 27 stop in for
storewide sales!

The store is open seven
days a week. Monday –
Thursday 9 a.m. to 5 p.m.,
Friday 9 a.m. to 7 p.m., Sat-
urday 9 a.m. to 4 p.m., and
Sunday 10 a.m. to 2 p.m.
They can also be found on
Facebook and Instagram.
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Independence Health system offers expert care, here

Submitted photo.
Earlier this year the Independence Health System Clarion Hospital unveiled its

state-of-the-art magnetic resonance imaging (MRI) technology and newly reno-
vated suite during a ribbon-cutting ceremony. In the above photo, from left, are:
Markelle Matthews, MRI technologist (Clarion Hospital); Jeff Mechling, director of
imaging services (Clarion and Butler Memorial Hospital); Karen Allen, president
(Clarion and Butler Memorial Hospital); Terri Sherry, Radiology and Imaging Services
Manager (Clarion Hospital) Dr. Michael Fiorina, CMO (Clarion and Butler Memorial
Hospital); Cindy Yarger, MRI technologist (Clarion Hospital); Leslie Walters, CNO
(Clarion and Butler Memorial Hospital);  Scott Koscho, vice president, support ser-
vices (IHS); Matt Schnur, vice president of ancillary services (Clarion and Butler
Memorial Hospital)

Submitted article
MONROE TWP. — As

the third largest health sys-
tem in the region, Indepen-
dence Health System
remains committed to serv-
ing its communities as it
enhances access to high-
quality healthcare across
Western Pennsylvania. With
clinical expertise in cardiolo-
gy, cardiothoracic surgery,
cancer care, orthopedics,
women’s care, stroke care
and more, the system con-
tinues to advance the
boundaries of medicine in
the region. 

Over the past year, Inde-
pendence Health System
expanded access to specialty
services in the Clarion area,
including bariatric weight
loss consultations, plastic
and reconstructive surgery,
pulmonary rehabilitation,
Mohs micrographic surgery,
and enhanced access to vas-
cular, electrophysiology and
general surgery specialists. 
Technological
advancements

Earlier this year, Clarion
Hospital introduced new
MRI technology, improving
patient comfort and diag-
nostic accuracy. Indepen-
dence Health System also
expanded access to its lung
cancer screening program in
Butler and Clarion through
the Advanced Lung Center,
and Butler Memorial
installed the Johnson &
Johnson MedTech’s
MONARCH platform - a
robotic bronchoscopy system
that enhances precision in
obtaining tissue samples for
the biopsy of lung nodules.
Cardiovascular
excellence

Clarion Hospital recently
celebrated 20 years of con-
tinuous echocardiography
accreditation from the Inter-
societal Accreditation Com-
mission (IAC); a milestone
achieved by only 77 facilities
nationwide. The system per-
forms more than 32,000
echocardiograms annually
across its five hospitals -
Butler Memorial, Clarion,
Frick, Latrobe and West-
moreland – all of which are
IAC-accredited.
Expanded services at
Trinity Point

The Health and Wellness

Center at Trinity Point con-
tinues to grow, offering
patients access to high-qual-
ity care in one convenient
location. Services include:

� Cardiology
� Cardiothoracic sur-

gical consultations
� Electrophysiology
� Vascular surgical

consultations
� Cardiac & Pul-

monary Rehabilitation
� Primary care
� Pulmonology
� Food Institute and

Lifestyle Coaching
� Walk-in laboratory,

X-ray and EKG Services
� Women’s care and

women’s imaging. 
The Family Medicine

Residency Clinic at Trinity
Point welcomes four new
residents in July and offers
walk-in services Monday
through Friday, 8 a.m. to 10
a.m., including wellness
checks, flu shots, care for
minor injuries, and more.

The Women’s Imaging
Center provides walk-in 3D
Mammography services
every Wednesday from noon
to 4 p.m. Walk-in laboratory
services, X-ray, and EKG
services are available week-
days from 7:30 a.m. to 4 p.m.

Lifestyle Coaching semi-
nars are available in person,
virtually and on demand -
free to the community.
Healthcare professionals
lead these evidence-based
courses. For more informa-
tion, visit www.indepen-
dence.health/services/lifesty
le-coaching/. 

Cancer care in Clarion
In September, the Clari-

on Hospital Cancer Center
hosted its 21st annual Light
Up Night at the Clarion
Eagle’s Pavilion, honoring
patients, caregivers and
community supporters.
Since 2003, the center has
provided outpatient medical
oncology services, including
chemotherapy and state-of-
the-art radiation therapy. It
is accredited by the Ameri-
can College for Radiation
Oncology through its APEx
program. 

In June 2025, the Cancer
Center introduced a new
treatment option to help
patients experiencing dis-

comfort from osteoarthritis:
low-dose radiation therapy.
This non-invasive treat-
ment option is administered
twice a week over a three-
week period and is designed
to reduce inflammation and
improve joint function.

Patients may be eligable
if they:

� Are over the age of
50

� Have experienced
osteoarthritis symptoms for
more than three months

� Have not under-
gone joint relacement for
the affected joint

� Continue to experi-
ence symptoms despite con-
servative management with
NSAIDs and/or physical
therapy 

To learn more or deter-
mine eligability, contact the
Clarion Hospital Cancer
Center at 814-226-1970 or
speak with a healthcare
provider.
Breakthrough
Alzheimer’s care

In August of 2024, Inde-
pendence Health System
became the first in the
region to offer advanced
diagnostic and treatment
options for Alzheimer’s dis-
ease. These services are
available at the Butler and
Westmoreland area cam-
puses, providing critical
support to patients and fam-
ilies facing this growing
health concern.

Leadership transitions
In 2025, the system

announced several leader-
ship transitions. Karen
Allen, president of Butler
Memorial and Clarion Hos-
pitals, retired in June.
Matthew Schnur, a Butler
native with a Doctor of
Pharmacy degree from
Duquesne University has
been named her successor.

Michael Sekhon was pro-
moted to Vice President of
Ancillary Services, oversee-
ing pharmacy, laboratory,
and radiology service lines
for the system. Chief Med-
ical Officer (CMO), Dr. Carol
Fox retired in June. Dr.
Michael Fiorina, who had
been serving as Associate
CMO for Butler Memorial
and Clarion Hospitals, has
been named her successor.

Anthony Cancro was
named Chief Development
Officer, overseeing the four
hospital foundations, and
Kelley Skoloda was appoint-
ed Chief Marketing and
Communications Officer for
the system.
Clarion Hospital
Foundation 

The Clarion Hospital
Foundation is dedicated to
supporting and enhancing
quality health care, educa-
tion, and overall community
wellness through various
projects and services. The
generosity of donors and
supporters has enabled the
Foundation to assist Clarion
Hospital in its mission over
many years. Contributions,
sponsorships, and donations
have funded numerous ini-
tiatives. Highlights of 2025
include:

� Handbags for

Health designer purse bingo
event raised more than
$20,000 to support the Clar-
ion Hospital Ambulance
Fund. Clarion Hospital
EMS responds to approxi-
mately 7,300 requests annu-
ally, covering 750 square
miles. Due to the aging fleet,
replacing a 2005 ambulance
was identified as a high pri-
ority. In April, the Founda-
tion transferred over
$90,000 to the hospital to
aid in the purchase of a new
ambulance and EMS equip-
ment. The funding was
made possible through the
success of the Handbags for
Health events and the gen-
erous support of community
members and organizations. 

� In partnership with
the Clarion Rotary, the
Foundation held their bian-
nual Multiphasic Blood
Screening in early May, rais-

ing more than $23,000. Over
250 community members
and staff participated in the
screening which offered 60 +
blood panel tests.

� The 2024 Clarion
Hospital Foundation Golf
Tournament raised over
$27,000 to support hospital
initiatives that serve the
community. The 2025 tour-
nament, titled “Driving Fore
Community Health,” is
scheduled for July 25 at
Clarion Oaks Golf Club.
Team registrations and
sponsorships are currently
being accepted. 

� Healthcare and
nursing scholarships pro-
vided through the Founda-
tion assisted eleven area
high school students and
one college student pursu-
ing a career in the medical
field.

See IHS, Page 7
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CRBC is the OG of Clarion microbreweries
By Kenn Staub 

For the CLARION NEWS

CLARION
Clarion’s original

microbrewery, Clarion
River Brewing Company
(CRBC), is celebrating its
10th anniversary in
2025. Not only was CRBC
the first microbrewery in
the immediate Clarion-
area, but it remains the
only one to feature a full-
service restaurant. 

Bryan Smith, co-own-
er of CRBC with Jeremy
Borkowski, is excited
about both the food and
beer at the establishment
on 600 Main Street, giv-
ing credit to chef Brian
Gonzalez and brewmas-
ter Devin Smith, respec-
tively.

Talking about Gonza-
lez, who has been CRBC’s
chef for approximately
three years, Smith said,
“He’s got a very diverse
history. He helped us
revitalize our new menu,
which came out in the
spring of 2025. He’s been
working with local
providers, we’re trying to
incorporate a lot more
local options as far as
what we have on the
menu and in the fea-
tures. 

“He’s creative, he puts
out the types of food we
know have sold well for
years, but he puts his
own spin on everything.
He’s keeping things
fresh, trying new things
that could potentially
become staples. He’s
received great feedback,
‘Wow, your food has never
been this good, this con-
sistent.’ He produces
quality food time-in and
time-out.”

Smith continued, pro-
viding a thumbnail
sketch of the current
menu, “We still definitely
have a fairly extensive
menu. We’ve scaled back
on our features, [we
have] anywhere from

three-to-four features on
a weekly basis. We’re still
doing either a burger or
sandwich of the week.
There’s always a local
beef option and one or
two things that we have
seasonally.”

CRBC offers a variety
of beers, including flag-
ships such as Golden
Eagle Pilsner – a light,
easy drinking lager – and
1841 Amber Lager – a
roasty, multi-brown – as
well as more seasonal
brews.

Making sure the brew-
ery’s 12 taps are supplied
with high quality beer is
brewmaster Devin
Smith, who earned a cer-
tificate in brewing and
fermentation science
from Penn College of
Technology (PCT) during
May 2024.

As to what she
learned at PCT, Devin
relayed, “Everything and
anything that is perti-
nent to brewing – raw
materials, the microbiol-
ogy of yeast, the biome-
chanics of the brewing
process, the mechanics of
the brewing equipment –
pretty much everything
that is brewing or brew-
ery adjacent.

“People would be sur-
prised at the depth of
brewing, the math and
science. It’s a very pre-
cise art, there’s a lot of
math and science that
goes into brewing a beer.”

Though there were
established recipes for
the brewery’s flagships,
Devin has incorporated
her own ideas into their
brewing process, as well
as created new offerings.

“I’ll be thinking about
wanting to incorporate
an ingredient or I think
about what I would want
to drink, how I would
want a flavor profile to
be” relayed Devin on the
creative aspects of brew-
ing. “From there, I back-
track and build my

recipes off of, ‘What do I
want?’”

“I truly feel that every
time I release a new beer,
I’m releasing a new piece
of art.”

As brewmaster, Devin
believes making a high
quality product is para-
mount.

“It’s a tough time in
our industry right now,
consumers are getting to
a point where they’re not
necessarily tolerating a
lesser quality product,”
she observed. “The high-
er the quality the product
and the more consistent-
ly good it is, the more
likely your customers are
going to continue coming
back.”

Two of Devin’s beers
recently garnered recog-
nition, winning medals at
the Denver International
Beer Competition – a sil-
ver in the British Brown
Ale category for her
Leatherwood beer and a
bronze in the Belgian
Tripel category for a
brew she calls Liquid
Long Johns.

On the significance of
winning those awards,
she said, “It means I am
on the right path, I’m
doing what I should be
doing, especially so early
on in my tenure as head
brewer. You don’t normal-
ly hear of brewers within
their first year or two
winning international
awards and having that
recognition in the indus-
try. To me, it’s definitely
a sign that I’m doing
okay.”

In early June Devin
was voted president for
the Pittsburgh district of
the Master Brewers
Association of the Ameri-
cas, an organization
focused on making
knowledge and education
pertaining to continued
quality improvement
more accessible to brew-
ers.

In addition to its loca-

tion on Main Street,
CRBC has, for a third
consecutive year, opened
a seasonal spot in Cook
Forest at the edge of
MacBeth’s Cabins’s park-
ing lot. 

“Things are rolling up
there,” reported Bryan.
“I’ve made small
improvements every
year. Last year I put on a
deck, this year I put a
roof over the deck.”

“This year the weath-
er’s been terrible, so it’s
been a little bit of a
rough start. We’re even-
tually going to have sum-
mer, I hope.”

The fact that CRBC
has been around for 10
years is not something
the Smiths take lightly.

“Being on Main Street
in downtown Clarion and
having been here so long,
we’ve become ingrained
in the community,” con-
tributed Devin. “It’s
important that we’re
interactive and collabo-
rative with the communi-
ty, just making sure that
we’re keeping our roots.”

Added Bryan, “I think
we’ve become a corner-
stone of the community.
We think we’re a great
option for both high qual-

ity food, high quality bev-
erages, and a great
atmosphere you can just
relax and enjoy yourself
in.”

CRBC is open Monday
through Thursday 4 p.m.
to 9 p.m.; Friday and Sat-
urday 11:30 a.m. to 9:30
p.m.; and Sunday 11:30
a.m. to  8 p.m.

For more information
on CRBC, including a
menu and beer list, see
its Facebook page (Clari-
on River Brewing Com-
pany), Instagram (@clari-
onriverbrew), or website
( h t t p s : / / w w w. c l a r i o n -
riverbrew.com/).�
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CLARION NEWS photo by Kenn Staub.
Pictured above is CRBC Brewmaster Devin Smith.
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Check Facebook for hours and opening days

3121 Forest Road • Vowinckel, PA 16260
www.TheForestNook.com

814-927-5440
Great Homemade Food!

Family style restaurant in the heart of
Cook Forest!   Inside-Outside Dining or

Call for Take-out.  NOOK NACS Gift 
Shop has a great selection of 

handcrafted items for purchase.

Homemade Desserts made Fresh Daily!

Jamie
Thompson

AGENT
110 Main St., Clarion, PA

814-226-5463

“Like a good neighbor, State Farm is there”.

Call me today for a free quote.

1123 Old Fryburg Road

Lucinda, PA 16235

814-226-7344

Open Tuesday-Saturday

4pm to 9pm

TheWaysideLucinda.com

RANKIN
AUCTION 
SERVICE

Clarion, PA
www.AuctionZip.com ID#1585

Complete Auction
Services & Appraisals

Dan
(814)

379-9862

Gary
(814)

764-3502

ALUMINUM • BATTERIES

BRASS • COPPER • CARS

SHEET IRON • HEAVY IRON

SCRAP IRON & 
METALS BUYER

724.256.9044

1200 E. RT 422

FENELTON

For All Your Lumber & Building Supply Needs

29227 RTE 66
LUCINDA, PA 16235

WWW.OCHSBUILDING.COM
OCHSBUILDING@ZOOMINTERNET.NET

814-226-7334
MONDAY THROUGH FRIDAY: 

7:00A.M. TO 5:00P.M.
SATURDAY: 7:00A.M. TO NOON

• 12 Packs 
• 6 Packs 
• Singles Available

9 North 4th Ave
Open 7 Days A Week

KOOMAN, HEETER & GULNAC, PC
Marianne Professional Center, 10385

Route 322, Suite 1
Shippenville, PA 16254

Terry R. Heeter
David M. Gulnac

Areas of Law
Business Law ~ Real Estate

Estate planning ~ Estate Adminstration

814-226-9100

BUSINESS DIRECTORY

www.buggguy.com
Hooper@hhpestmanagement.com

5018 South Reidsburg Rd., Sligo, PA 16255

Residential & 
Commercial

FREE Service 
Estimates

Owner: Hugh “Hooper” Henry

HIRSCH’S 
MEATS
HIRSCH’S 
MEATS

MEATS ARE OUR BUSINESS

Complete Collision Repair
Towing Services

Michael L. Harriger
Since 1963

15698 Route 68 
Sligo, PA

814-745-2420

Sapphire Moon
Healing Arts Center

Jennifer A. Keth, L.M.T., C.N.C

21174 Route 322 • Corsica, PA 
I-80, Exit 70 • 814-379-3085

www.sapphiremoon.biz 

★ Massage Therapy
★ Reiki

★ CranioSacral Therapy
★ Nutritional Consulting

★ Gift Certificates
★ Hot Stone Massage

Hours by Appointment
Member ABMP • AANC#MSG001266

FAMILY FUN PLACE

`ljmibqb=`liifpflk
^ka=orpq=obm^fo

All Insurance 
Companies Welcome

TOQJUSTJRUTN
shermansautorepair78@gmail.com

TMP=oçÅâÇ~äÉ=oÇK
bãäÉåíçåI=m^

Sherman’s AUTO 
Repair

632 Broad Street
New Bethlehem

Route 338
Knox

562 Main Street
Rimersburg

www.tomsriverside.com

Quality Foods

Clarion County’s Full Service
Supermarket Since 1970

Tuesday-Thursday 11am-7pm
Friday 11am-8pm � Saturday 8am-8pm

Sunday 8am-4pm � Closed Monday

Tuesday-Friday 11am-7pm

Saturday 8am-7pm

Sunday 8am-4pm • Closed Monday

Call now and book your stay 
or go to campspot.com

1507 Coulter Road • Knox, PA
814-549-0665

• 12 campsites, picnic table and fire pit, 
full water, sewage and 20 amp/50 amp 

electrical service hook up
• Cabin rental • Pet friendly • Children’s playground 

• Cornhole  • Creek stocked during trout season

7-acre campground nestled in the woods

PENNA.
OFFICIAL

INSPECTION
STATION

CERTIFIED
AUTO CARE

814-226-4624
South 5th Avenue • Clarion • ½ Mile from
Clarion Mall, Behind Computer Support

• Check Engine Light Diagnostic & Repair
• Now offering wheel alignments
• Heating and Air Conditioning Service
• Brakes, Shocks & Struts
• Exhaust & Pipe Bending
• Engine & Electrical Repair

12479 Harrison Street,
Summerville, Pa

100 Knox Road
Knox, PA

www.sharpshopper.net

`çìåíêó=pÉííáåÖI=
`áíó=`çåîÉåáÉåÅÉ

NPV=^Åçêå=aêKI=
pÉåÉÅ~=m^=NSPQS

mÜçåÉW=UNQJSTSJMNVP
éáåç~â]éçëáíáîÉJÜçìëáåÖKÅçã

qÜáë=áë=~=ÖêÉ~í=íáãÉ=íç=~ééäó=
Ñçê=~=O=_o=~é~êíãÉåí

Wolf’s Den Sports 
Cards & Collec�bles

WE BUY & SELL TRADING
CARDS AND COLLECTIBLES

Owner: Sco� Wolfgang
wolf2170@yahoo.com

(814) 771-5618
345 East Main Street

Reynoldsville, PA 15851

Support Locally 
Owned Businesses!

COOK FOREST
STATE PARK

6 Cabins
3 Cabins with Hot Tub

ADA Cabin
Brand New Gift Shop

ATM
Skills Games

Grocery
Camping

Crafts and Gifts
Now Selling PA Lottery

Open 
Year Round!

800-851-6377
www.hominyridge.com

13964 Rt. 36 
Clarington, PA 15828

COOK FOREST 
STATE PARK

hominyridgecabins@gmail.com

� 8 E. First St. 
Oil City, PA 16301

814.676.8541

� 7147 Route 322
Cranberry, PA 16319

814.437.7641

� 320 Main St.
Clarion, PA 16214

814.226.5131

� gatesandburnsrealestate.com

Full Line of Real Estate Services

Turn Your Valuables
Into Cash!!!

REYNOLDSVILLE
SWAP SHOP
Buying Coins, Jewelry, Gold,

Antiques, and More!

Call Us NOW:
814-771-9995
814-590-7766

ACE is the place for your hardware needs and more
By Kenn Staub 

For the CLARION NEWS

CLARION
ACE Hardware is one of

the newer businesses in Clar-
ion, opening at 527 Main
Street on Groundhog Day
2024.

While some might find a
hardware business in a two-
story building unique, it’s
really nothing out of the ordi-
nary for owners Kevin and
Mark Salandra, who have
another store in Brockway.

“Our store in Brockway is
also two floors, it’s a first-floor
basement. Our store in Brock-
way also has a walk-in safe,
just like this store does,” noted
Kevin Salandra during a tour.
“There were a lot of similari-
ties when we found the [Clar-
ion] building, so it wasn’t like,
‘Oh, this is going to be a novel
experience.’

“We thought we would
actually have more room than
what we did. We filled up the
building, it’s kind of crazy. We
have a lot of people coming in
wanting us to sell conve-
nience lumber, drywall, build-
ing materials, we don’t have
room.”

As to what some of the
more popular products are at
the Clarion location, Salandra
said, “That’s tough, because
it’s very seasonal. This time of
year [early summer] we’re
crazy selling mowers and

weed trimmers, chainsaws,
hedge trimmers. We’ve sold a
lot more chainsaws this
spring than normal because
we had a little bit of a windy,
tough winter and people had
a lot of cleaning-up to do.”

“We do [sell] a ton of
plumbing, electrical, hard-
ware, Stihl products [mowers,
weed trimmers], paint, lawn
and garden.”

ACE also makes keys,
something Salandra indicat-
ed the big box stores don’t do
as much of anymore. Services
such as screen repair and
glass cutting are also avail-
able.

If customer can’t find the
item they are looking for
among the almost 18,000
unique products in stock,
ACE probably has it among
the 70,000 different things
available online at
https://www.acehardware.co
m/. Customers can have
online orders shipped to them
directly or to the store.

Added Salandra, “Basical-
ly, if there’s something that
you need that you don’t see,
ask us, because we do have a
lot that we can order, even
direct from the manufacturer.

“We’re also constantly
making changes. If people
come in and request items
that we don’t have in stock,
once we get a few requests for
that item, then we add it to
our inventory.”

Like all businesses, the
effects of a dynamic economy
have impacted prices.

“For the customers, prices
are going up, it’s pretty much
across the board” relayed
Salandra. “The vendors that
haven’t raised prices [yet]
have sent notices saying
they’re going to raise prices, it
just depends on how much
the increase is going to be.”

“Some vendors do a little
bit more overseas or have
more components coming in
from overseas, they’ve had
higher price increases. Others
have maintained lower
prices.” 

Clarion has proved wel-
coming to Salandra’s busi-
ness, “The community has
been very supportive. We
have good repeat customers.
We’ve special ordered some
things that other people
weren’t able to get elsewhere.
It’s interesting to meet a lot of
people.”

Salandra attributed the
successful launch of ACE
Hardware to its employees.

“We’ve got a lot of great
employees, we have a really
good team in place,” he
offered. “We have a lot of very
knowledgeable employees
that can help solve your prob-
lems – what type of paint to
use, what plumbing or electri-
cal parts you need. We have
people that have had 30 years
and more in the building

CLARION NEWS photo by Kenn Staub.
Pictured is ACE Hardware co-owner Kevin Salandra in front of the Milwaukee

Tool display at the ACE Hardware store on Main Street in Clarion Borough.
trades. We pride ourselves in
giving customer service.”

ACE Hardware is open
seven days a week – Monday
through Friday 7 a.m. to 7
p.m.; Saturday 7 a.m. to 6
p.m.; and Sunday 9 a.m. to 4

p.m.
As to the store’s long hours

of operation, Salandra said, “If
we didn’t have those hours,
we wouldn’t be serving our
customers properly. A lot of
people need to stop before

work, after work, maybe on
their way to a job.”  

Information on ACE
Hardware can be found on
Instagram (@aceharware) or
its webpage (https://www.ace-
hardware.com/).
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Daddy’s Main St. offers great food at a reasonable price

Numerous churches serve southern Clarion County

CLARION NEWS photo by Kenn Staub.
The Daddy’s Main Street location has been a popular place since its opening in

2008.

said, ‘We cater all events.’
It cost me $18 [the sign].
That was my game, that
was my business plan.”

“My sister, Janine, was
brought in shortly after
we started, she is a mar-
velous baker. Now 10, 12
years later I think we’re
one of the busiest caterers
around. I know there’s
people that do more vol-
ume, but I don’t think
there’s anybody that does
more parties.”

Troese attributes his

catering success to a
number of factors – low
cost, a top-notch crew
that stays at events to
provide service, old-fash-
ioned business practices
(most times there are no
contracts and deposits are
rarely required), and a
willingness to assist cus-
tomers and accommodate
their requests. 

Just as Clarion has an
affection for Daddy’s,
Troese has an affection
for Clarion, “We love the

town, I was born and
raised here. We’ve had the
opportunity to get off of
Main Street, half a dozen
times. We don’t want to
leave. We’ve been fortu-
nate.”

Daddy’s is open Tues-
day through Friday 11
a.m. to 7 p.m. and Satur-
day noon to 7 p.m. 

For more information,
including a menu and list
of daily specials, visit
Daddy’s Facebook page
(Daddy’s Main Street).

By Kenn Staub 
For the CLARION NEWS

CLARION
When Dana and Jean

Troese opened Daddy’s
Main Street during
March 2008, it was just
supposed to be a hot dog
shop. 

“I always loved the
idea of a hot dog shop. As
a matter of fact, one of the
slogans we used when we
opened was ‘Every great
town ought to have a
great hot dog shop,’”
relayed Dana Troese.
“The Hot Dog House [an
establishment owned by
Edward “Eddie” Dorn-
brock that once stood on
Sixth Avenue] was always
popular, although very
low volume. We thought
we could do a lot more
volume. We started out
with mostly hot dogs,
cheese steaks, home cut
fries, and Primanti-style
sandwiches.”

That simple menu has
since morphed into so
much more, to the point
the offerings at Daddy’s
are perhaps the most
eclectic in the area. 

Not only does Troese
offer staples such as vari-
ously styled hamburgers
and hotdogs, fresh cut
fries, roasted chicken, and
an assortment of wings,
but on any given day he
might be running specials
on Cajun food including
jambalaya, alligator, and
po’boys; Italian favorites
spaghetti with meatballs
and chicken parmesan; or
barbeque fare including
ribs, pulled pork, and
baked beans.

“We realized early on
that we weren’t going to
make any stupendous liv-
ing off of doing hot dogs,
even though we thought
we had a really good prod-
uct,” said Troese. “Darren
[Troese, Dana’s son] came
in and he started running
the line and that pretty
much put me in a spot
where I was able to think
and pre-cook. We end up
trying to one up it every
day.”

Troese talked about
collaborating with his
son, “I’ll go through the
coolers, talk to my suppli-
ers, and I get something
and I cook it tonight so
it’s ready for him [Dar-
ren] tomorrow. We’re tak-
ing all these raw products
and I’m marinating them,
roasting them, cooling
them the day before. 

“He [Darren] doesn’t
spend all night worrying
about it. He’ll come in
fresh and I just hand it off
to him. I’ll say, ‘I’ve got 15
pounds of chicken thighs
in a Mexican marinade,’
and that’s all I’ll tell him.
He’ll come in and do a
great job [with whatever
ingredients have been
prepped in advance].
Between the two of us, we
do a pretty good job.”

Troese continued, talk-
ing about the other mem-
bers of his team, “My
staff, I have had many
good ones over the years,
but this crew is the best
I’ve had in 45 years. We
have all been in the cut-
throat corporate world
and we choose to do it dif-
ferently. We are a family
and we rely on each other

every day.”
Almost everybody who

comes into Daddy’s
receives personal atten-
tion.

“Customers come in
here, whether it’s to take
out food or whether it’s to
sit and eat, and they get
treated like they’re the
only customer in the
joint,” Troese noted.

“On any given day, I
try to have a couple of
contacts with everybody
that’s here. My first ques-
tion will be, if I catch
them sitting down, ‘Did
you get ordered?’ Then I’ll
come check on you and
then the food comes out
and I’ll come over and ask
how you’re doing. It’s
something I enjoy.”

He continued, “I think
most chefs have spent a
lot of their lives in the
back kitchen and don’t get
the opportunity to inter-
act with their customers.
After being behind the
[kitchen] doors for 20
years it’s a real breath of
fresh air. That’s what the
business is really about,
cooking food and watch-
ing your customers enjoy.”

Troese runs a success-
ful catering business out
of the restaurant, a ven-
ture that had a relatively
low-key start.

“My wife and I decided
we were going to start
catering. We were no
strangers to catering from
the Loomis [the former
Captain Loomis Bar and
Restaurant on Main
Street], although we’d
never done it on any large
scale,” recounted Troese.
“We put up a sign that

NEW BETHLEHEM—
Among the churches 
serving the residents of
southern Clarion County
are:

First Baptist
Limestone

814-764-5348
Pastor: Mike Schreck-

engost
First Baptist Church

is an independent, funda-
mental Baptist church.

Sunday school: 10
a.m.

Sunday services: 11
a.m. and 6 p.m. 

Bible and prayer
meeting: 7 p.m. on
Wednesday

Ladies of Lime-
stone: 6 p.m. on the third 
Thursday each month
that includes a card min-
istry and a ladies Bible
study

Cottage Hill
Church
St. Route 66 and Champion
Rd., three miles north of  

New Bethlehem
814-229-3129

Pastor: Rev. Daniel R.
Clyde

Youth Leader:
Gabriel Clyde

Three miles north of
New Bethlehem at the
corner of State Route 66
and Champion Road. 

Approximately 40 fam-
ilies are members of the
congregation. Atten-
dance: 175 people per
month

Sunday school: 10
a.m.

Sunday worship ser-
vice: 11 a.m. and 
6:30 p.m. Children’s Min-
istries at 11 a.m.;Youth
service: 6 p.m. on Sunday

Prayer meeting:
7:30 p.m. on Wednesday

Missionary Service:
Third Wednesday of the
month.

Bible School and other
activities are held during
the summer.

N.B. Presbyter-
ian
403 Penn St., New Bethlehem

814-275-1880
Interim pastor: Rev.

Dr. Jack Gareis
There are 30 members.
Sunday service and

children’s Sunday
school: 9:30 a.m.

Sunday school
(adults and teens):
10:45 a.m.

Cub Scouts and Boy
Scouts Pack 403: Cub
Scouts meet at 7 p.m.,

Mondays; Boy Scouts
meet at 7 p.m., Tuesdays.

Other activities
throughout the year 
include a summer wor-
ship service held the last 
Sunday in June with
Tidal Presbyterian
Church.

First Baptist
Church

249 Broad St.
New Bethlehem
814-275-2959

Pastor: Randy Hopper
Average attendance is 35.

Sunday school: 9:30
a.m.

Worship ser-
vice:10:30 a.m.

Bible study: 7 p.m. on
Wednesday

We also belong to the
Redbank Valley Church
Association.

St. Charles
Catholic

201 Washington St., 
New Bethlehem
814-275-3446

St. Nicholas
Catholic

Crates
Pastor: Rev. Samuel

Bungo
St. Charles has 200

households. St. Nicholas
has 70 households.

St. Charles—Masses:
5:30 p.m. Saturday, 
10 a.m. Sunday and 9
a.m. Monday, Tuesday,
and Thursday. Confes-
s i o n s :  
4 p.m., prior to mass on
Saturday or call to make
an appointment.

The church has an
active Altar Rosary Soci-
ety and Knights of
Columbus that meets
monthly. They also hold
several fund-raisers dur-
ing the year.

St. Nicholas—Mass:
9 a.m. Wednesday and 
8 a.m. Sunday. Confes-
sions heard Sunday
before mass or by
appointment.

The church partici-
pates with St. Charles
t h e  
community Lenten ser-
vices.

The church has an 
active Rosary Society.

First Church of
God 

418 Brian Lane
New Bethlehem

State Route 861, Porter Twp.
Located one mile east

of New Bethlehem.
There are 130 people

in the congregation.

Senior Pastor: Nick
Wilson

Sunday school: 9
a.m.

Sunday services: 10
a.m.

Bible study: 7 p.m.
Wednesday

Youth group (grades
7 to 12): 7 p.m. 
Wednesday

Children’s classes:
7 p.m. Wednesday

Men’s and Women’s 
Bible studies held period-
ically.

Grace Baptist
605 East Washington Street

New Bethlehem
814-275-4090

Pastor: Rev. Bob
Ryver

A s s o c i a t e / Yo u t h  
pastor: Curtis Twigg

Ministry assistant:
Amy Twigg

We are affiliated with
the Southern Baptist
Convention.

Average Sunday atten-
dance has increased to
more than 150 people.

Sunday school: 9
a.m.

Sunday services:
10:30 a.m. and small
group at 6 p.m. 

Youth group (grades
6-12): 6 to 8 p.m. Sundays

Godsprints 5th grade
and younger: 6 to 7 p.m.
Wednesdays during Sept.
through March

Men’s Bible Studies:
6:30 p.m. every other
Thursday

Web: gbcnewbethle-
hem.site

F a c e b o o k :  
facebook.com/GBC605/

Hawthorn Presby-
terian

Hawthorn
814-365-5967

The church has
approximately 25 mem-
bers.

Moderator: Rev.
James Dietrich

Pastors: Rex Munsee,
supply pastors, and 
members of congregation

Sunday worship:
9:30 a.m.

The church conducts
special worship services
throughout the year, and
participation in commu-
nity services with other
area churches is a goal. 
Everyone is welcome.
L e a t h e r w o o d
Church

889 Church Road 
New Bethlehem

Porter Township
814-275-4371

Approximately 150 to
175 attend Sunday 
services

Pastor: Rev. Doug
Henry

Sunday school: 9:30
a.m.

Sunday worship:
10:30 a.m.

Wednesday Supper
and Study: 6 p.m., dur-
ing the school year

Youth group: 
5:30 p.m., Sundays

Tractor Sunday: 
Aug. 24—For this event,
everyone is welcome to
bring their tractors and
lawn mowers as well as
your appetite.

Leatherwood joined
with Grace Community
Church in Curllsville for
Community Vacation
Bible School.

First Fellowship 
234 Penn St., New Bethlehem

814-275-3900
There are approxi-

mately 150 members.
Pastor: John Philips
Sunday school: 

9:45 a.m.
Sunday worship 

service: 11 a.m.
Bible study: 7 p.m.

Monday
Bible study: 10 a.m.

Thursday
Chancel (adult)

Choir: 7 p.m. Wednesday.
Hand bell choir: 

8 p.m. Wednesday
Oak Ridge:
Sunday service: 

9:45 a.m.
Fairmount City:

Doverspike Street, Route 28
Fairmount City Unit-

ed Methodist Charge 
Approximately 76 peo-

ple attend.
Sunday school: 9:30

a.m. 
Worship: 8:30 a.m.
Bible study: 6 p.m.

Wednesdays
Putneyville:
Located in the village

of Putneyville
Worship: 9:45 a.m.
Sunday school: 10:50

a.m.
New Salem Pierce

Church:
New Salem UMC is 

located near Mayport on
Pierce Road; 814-256-
3399 

Email: newsalem-
piercechurch@
gmail.com

Worship: 8:30 a.m.
Zion Lutheran
Church

3117 Pine Run Road, 
Mayport, off  of  State Route
28 half-way between Sum-
merville and Mayport

About 30 attend 
worship service and
about 10 attend Sunday
school.

Sunday school for
all ages at Bethlehem
Ohl, sister church: 9:30
a.m. at 3879 Langville
Road.

Sunday school at
Zion Shannondale: 10
a.m. at 3117 Pine Run

Sunday worship 
service at Zion Shan-
nondale: 11 a.m.

Zoom: 646-876-9923;
then enter 2750081381#

A Care Giving Min-
istry for the congregation
and community began in
Feb. 1998. There are 
ten members.

“Mary Circle” 
women’s circle: meets
as needed

Vacation Bible
School–The church will
hold VBS during the sum-
mer.

The church offers an
outdoor service at 8 a.m.
on Sundays in June, July,
and August.

Services are live
streamed through Zoom
and Facebook.

For additional infor-
mation or exact times,
call the church at 814-
856-2022 or send email: 
z i o n s h a n n o d a l e @
gmail.com 

Living Church
59 West Penn Street Sum-

merville
814-856-3500

Senior Pastors: 
David and Emily Shay

Approximately 80 
people attend the Living
Church International.

Sunday school: 
9:30 a.m.

Sunday worship 
service: 10:45 a.m.

Meal: 6 p.m. on the
third Sunday

Church website: 
livingchurch.family

Christ Dominion
Academy website:
christdominion.com

The church has a
school, Christ’s Dominion
Academy, for kinder-
garten through grade 12.
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Big projects highlight Palo’s summer

Red River Roadhouse is more than a steakhouse
By Kenn Staub 

For the CLARION NEWS

MONROE TWP.
At first glance, the Red

River Roadhouse, located
in the Clarion Mall, seems
like your typical steak-
house. Bo Lockwood, the
restaurant’s owner since
2017, begs to differ.

“A lot of people would
consider us primarily a
steakhouse, with maybe a
‘cookie cutter’ steakhouse
menu. I see it a little dif-
ferently,” relayed Lock-
wood. “It’s a broad menu.
We not only have steaks,
but also chicken and fish.
We have salmon, seafood,
lots of shrimp, crab cakes.
There’s a variety of salads,
sandwiches. I mean, real-
ly, the list goes on and on.”

“We have a kids’ menu
that’s $5.50, your kids will
be happy, your kids will be
full. You can bring your
children out for a good
meal and not have to pay
an arm-and-a-leg.”

Regardless of what you
order, Lockwood’s empha-
sis is on providing “True,
Real Food.”

“We try to stay with
whole foods, real foods, we
don’t throw in a lot of
processed anything. We
try to make sure every-
thing we serve is healthy,”
he said.

“That’s what I love, our
food is true. I have been to
places where the food you
eat sometimes doesn’t
agree with you because of
all the additive stuff.
That’s not here, that’s def-
initely not here.”

Lockwood continued,

“When you come here, you
order your proteins,
they’re real, they’re har-
vested the way they’re
supposed to be. Your
steaks, your chickens,
your meats, everything is
real and well taken care of
from the time it was in the
field till the time it reach-
es your plate.

“I always feel good
when a plate goes out, I
know we’re not aiding
issues in this country like
bad food and stuff like
that.”

Though the RRR Road-
house cooks with 100-per-
cent soy oil, the kitchen
recently trialed beef tal-
low for about a week and
haven’t ruled out using it
more in the future.

“The big movement
now [in the restaurant
industry] has been beef
tallow,” reported Lock-
wood. “We tried it, had it
in our fryers, and it
worked well. The food, the
flavor, everything is just
unbelievable. It’s all next
level.”

“The feedback we got,
nine out of 10 people loved
it. There’s that one that is
a little either not curious
or just not completely sold
on it yet. I understand.
We’ll probably in the
future be able to keep one
of each, have fryers with
beef tallow and oil fryers.”

In addition to the din-
ing room, the RRR Road-
house features a separate
19-seat bar in an area that
also includes four booths.
Those sitting in bar can
order from the full restau-
rant menu.

Noted Lockwood, “The
nice thing is the bar is
somewhat hidden com-
pared to the dining room,
so it has its own atmos-
phere. You can be some-
what private compared to
the dining room. Typically,
it’s a little more laid back
compared to up front.”

The RRR Roadhouse’s
catering operation can
handle both small and
large events.

“When I purchased the
restaurant, the previous
owner did catering to a
smaller extent. Our chef
and I, it’s just something
we branched off and start-
ed doing more and more.
Before we knew it, it was a
full-fledged situation,”

remarked Lockwood.
“We can do everything.

If you want a very small
situation, we can handle
that. If you want a full-
scale wedding, we can
handle that.

Like restaurants all
over, Lockwood has had to
meet the challenges of
increasing prices, not only
for food, but also for sup-
plies such as straws,
gloves, and glassware.

“There’s two ways you
could go – you could drop
the quality of your food or
you could keep prices the
same and just run with it,”
offered Lockwood. “I don’t
think that’s a way that we
would ever go [lowered
food quality], though I’ve

seen plenty of restaurants
do it. We decided to stay
with the high quality food
and just raises our prices
a little, assuming some of
the cost instead of gouging
customers out.”

“We just take it one day
at a time and adjust as
needed. We just pray
everything stays in the
right direction and bal-
ances, that it doesn’t get
out of whack.”

Lockwood, from the
Brookville-area, believes,
like so many local restau-
rant owners, in giving
back, “We try to do every-
thing we can. There’s a lot
of side things that hap-
pen, behind the scenes
with all the restaurants

and all the businesses
around here that help the
community. Any kind of
function, we try to make
sure we’re there, at least
‘kick in’ here or there, do
what we can to offer sup-
port.

The RRR Roadhouse in
open 11 a.m. to 9 p.m.
Monday to Thursday; 11
a.m. to 10 p.m. Friday and
Saturday; and 11 a.m. to 9
p.m. Sunday.

For more information
on RRR Roadhouse,
including a menu, see its
Facebook page (Red River
Roadhouse, Instagram
(@redriverroadhouse), or
w e b s i t e
(https: / /www.redriver-
roadhouse.com/).

Submitted photo.
Pictured is the work the Palo Heavy Highway division did on Jordan Road on

Interstate 90 in Erie County. The work had to be performed at night due to the high
volume of traffic on Interstate 90.

Submitted photo.
The above photo is a picture of one of the beams

being removed during the bridge replacement project
on Moore Road near Hazen in Jefferson County.

By Ryan S. Pugh
CLARION NEWS Editor

CLARION
If you have ventured

between Exit 62 of Inter-
state 80 and Main Street in
Clarion over the past few
months, you have seen a
portion of what the Francis
J. Palo, Inc. Heavy High-
way division has been up
to.

Palo is the prime con-
tractor on the $13,368,068
safety improvement project
on State Route 68 that
stretches from Dolby Street
in Monroe Township to
Trout Run in Clarion
Township.

The project includes the
widening of State Route 68
and the installation of a
turning lane. There is also
a sidewalk being installed
that will allow pedestrians
to walk from Trout Run to
Dolby Street without walk-
ing on the roadway.

“That’s a three-year
job,” Palo President Paul
Roman said about the pro-
ject on State Route 68.
“Scheduled for this year is
basically the utility reloca-
tions. Palo is relocating the
water and sewer lines and
the gas company and the
electric company working
for their relocations. That’s
pretty much the work for
this year.”

According to Roman, the
following two years Palo
will take care of making
the road wider.

Roman said the plan is
to connect the three lanes
that stretch from Main
Street to Trout Run and
the three lanes that run
from Interstate 80 to Dolby
Street.

“We are going to widen a
little bit on each side of
[State Route 68],” Roman
said. “They didn’t take a lot
of property on one side to
bother any individual land
owners. The one year, we
are going to widen to the
right with traffic on the left
and the next year we are
going to widen to the left
with traffic on the right.”

Roman said the process
of widening the roadway is
not as simple as it seems.

“When you do widening,
it’s not only just the widen-
ing, it’s the storm drainage,
the under drainage,”
Roman said. “There is a lot
more work [to it] than just
digging a hole and widen-
ing it.”

The addition of the side-
walk along the length of

the roadway is also some-
thing Roman is glad to see
getting done.

“That was one of the
goals of the job for people
to be able to walk to Wal-
mart safely,” Roman said.
“The outcome of the job is
that it is going to be safer
for the driving public and
the walking public.”

The second biggest job
Palo is working on, accord-
ing to Roman is a bridge
replacement on Interstate
90 in Erie County.

“Right now, the demoli-
tion is done and we are in
the process of putting
back,” Roman said. “We
had to remove the bridge
over Interstate 90 and it
all had to happen at night.”

Currently, Palo is recon-
structing bridges on Cher-
ry Run in Clarion County,
near Hazen in Jefferson
County and in Indiana in
Indiana County.

The bridge on Cherry
Run Road is the Cherry
Run Church Bridge project
and it is estimated to be
completed Nov. 21 of this
year. At a total cost of
$1,342,007.

All the bridge recon-
structions are scheduled to
be completed this year.

Roman said that Palo

was being subcontracted
by Glenn O. Hawbaker
Construction for a recon-
struction project on Inter-
state 80 near the Ohio-
Pennsylvania line.

“They are basically
rebuilding Interstate 80
from the Ohio line to mile
marker five in Mercer
County and we are going to
build the structures on it,”
Roman said. “That is also a
three year job.”

There are some other
small projects Palo is going
to be undertaking soon
including rehabilitating a
suspension bridge in Cook
Forest, a installing a water
treatment plant at the
Mercer rest are on Inter-
state 79 and a rehabilita-
tion of the Clintonville
sewage treatment plant.

“We’re working for a
variety of owners; Pen-
nDOT, DCNR, local munic-
ipalities like always,”
Roman said. “We don’t just
work for PennDOT, we
work for a lot of locals.”

Another job Roman was
surprised Palo got was con-
structing a new hangar at
the Indiana County air-
port.

“There has been some
airport money coming here
lately,” Roman said. “That

had been missing the last
few years. There really
wasn’t much work going on
at airports.”

Palo is also working on
slope stabilization on the
Clarion River at Piney
Dam 

Palo has two construc-
tion divisions; heavy high-
way and industrial con-
struction.

The industrial con-
struction division has a
number of projects it is
involved in.

Along with the con-
struction divisions, Palo
has the Clarion Environ-
mental Services Division
which has been providing
services to clients across
Pennsylvania since 2003.
According to the Palo web-
site, the environmental
services division special-
izes in asbestos abate-
ment, asbestos building
inspection, asbestos air
testing, mold and mildew
remediation, mold testing,
shot blasting of floor mas-
tics, and interior/exterior
demolition.   

In addition to the two
construction divisions and
the environmental services
division, Palo also operates
the CNG fuel station at
Exit 64 on Interstate 80.

The CNG station was
one of the first stations in
the area to offer alterna-
tive fuels including natural
gas, liquid propane, on-
and off- road diesel and
regular unleaded fuel. 

Those who become a
customer of the CNG sta-
tion will receive five cents
off per gallon and there are
volume discounts avail-
able. The CNG station
accepts all major credit
cards.

“We’re always trying to
make improvements out
there,” Roman said about
the CNG station. “We did
some work out there this
spring already.”

According to Chief
Financial Officer Stephe-
nie Marshall, Palo is plan-
ning to add another gas
pump at the CNG station
this fall.

“Business is good, we
need more pumps,” Roman
said.

Marshall said that the
gas prices at the CNG sta-
tion were competitive with
other stations around the
area.

“If people decide they
want to become a [CNG]
customer, they will save an
additional five cents off per
gallon and that includes

our diesel and our gaso-
line,” Marshall said.

Roman said Palo has a
full staff of employees for
the summer with 50 full-
time workers and 100 part-
time workers. The part-
time workers are on staff
from March through
November.

Francis J. Palo, Inc.
originated as Francis J.
Palo Excavating in 1954.
Francis J. Palo, Inc. was
incorporated in 1973.

The company’s officers
and office staff include
Chief Executive Officer
Michael Palo, who has
been with Palo more than
30 years; President Ro-
man; Executive Vice Pres-
ident Mark Schaffer; Chief
Financial Officer Marshall
and Industrial Division
Vice-President Jason Kiely.

Safety continues to be a
top priority for Palo.

To keep up to date with
Palo’s current projects and
job openings or to learn
more about the company,
visit www.paloinc.com/.
Palo also has a LinkedIn
page. Palo has a 3A1 credit
rating with Dunn & Brad-
street and several local
and regional banking affil-
iations, according to its
website.�
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IS NOW HIRING!!

Please apply in person at these UCIP Offices
Clarion Office - 11279 Rt. 322 Clarion, PA � Crawford Office - 17999 Cussewago Rd, Meadville, PA

Venango Office - 155 East Bissell Avenue, Oil City, PA

PLEASE APPLY ONLINE AT
WWW.UCIPONLINE.COM

DIRECT SUPPORT
PROFESSIONALS

United Community Independence Programs

 Caring People Supporting Quality of Life for All A REWARDING
CAREER 
IN YOUR
COMMUNITY

UCIP Full-Time Direct Service Professionals 

 $1 .00 per hour
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NOW 
HIRING!
FIND THE BEST 

LOCAL JOBS!
All interested individuals may contact the HR Dept. at New Light, Inc. 

PO Box 761, Clarion, PA 16214 or call 814-226-6444 x103 or 
email hmche@newlightnewlife.net

NEW LIGHT, INC.
New Light, Inc. is now accepting applications for Direct Care

Personnel. This position will provide support for

intellectually/developmentally disabled individuals in a

community based residential program.

Pre-employment criminal background check must be free of any serious
offenses.  New Light, Inc. is an equal opportunity employer.

Are you a compassionate person looking 
for a great career opportunity?  

• Competitive Hourly Wages ($17/hr.) • Restraint/Restriction 
free agency • Weekends a must! • Benefit Package Available!

• Open Availability greatly appreciated! • Paid vacation! 
• Opportunity for advancement in company!

CNA’s NEEDED!

Shippenville area churches
SHIPPENVILLE —

Churches serving the Ship-
penville area include:

Manor UMC
Nine Airport Road, 

Paint Township, Shippenville
Pastor: Steve Ketner 
Sunday worship: 8:45

a.m.
Bible study: 7 p.m.

Wednesdays
Phone: 814-745-2480
Fully handicapped

accessible church
Shippenville UMC

123 Main Street, Shippenville
814-745-2480
814-316-1419

Shippenville United
Methodist church is part of
the Shippenville four-point
Charge with Curllsville,
Manor, and Monroe. 

Pastor: Steve Ketner 
Sunday worship: 11

a.m. 
The Shippenville

Charge hosts three com-
bined services for Ash
Wednesday, Maundy
Thursday, and Christmas
Eve.

Shippenville UM pro-
vides community 
support through various
outreach programs. Some
of those include a toy and
clothing drive in Dec. to
help families in need, 
contributions to the local 
food bank.

The church has a
clothes drop-off bin in its 
parking lot.

Another event taking
place at the church 
includes Thanksgiving din-
ner in November.

If you have any 
questions, please call the
church at 814-782-3202.

Holy Trinity
Lutheran

501 Main St., Shippenville
814-782-3753

The church has about
38 baptized members.

Pastor: Jeffrey Picciril-
li

Sunday worship:
10:30 a.m. 
Craft circle: 9:30 a.m.,

Saturdays. The group
makes stuffed animals for
Independence Health 
System—Clarion Hospital.
It also makes quilts and
puts together health kits to
send to Lutheran World
Relief for those in need.

Free sewing classes are
offered twice each year.

In the fall, the 
congregation collects do-
nations and puts together
school kits that will be
shipped to Lutheran 
World Relief.

Additionally, to help the
community the church
contributes money to Char-
itable Deeds.

C o r n e r s t o n e
Church of Clarion

3655 East End Road Ship-
penville

814-226-4949
Cornerstone Church of

Clarion’s mission is to
“Live for MORE: Making
Disciples Obeying God’s

Word; Reaching the Lost; 
Exalting Christ.” We are a
n o n - d e n o m i n a t i o n a l ,
vibrant, fun, loving,
relaxed and casual church
whose primary purpose is
to love God and our com-
munities with all our
hearts.  

We are a church that is
growing each and every
week as we continue to
share the love of Jesus
with people and meet them
where they are in their
walk. There are no perfect
people at Cornerstone. We
are a family who seek to
love more, learn more, and
lean more on Jesus as he
leads us, as he loves us,
and as he continues to
grow us.  

At Cornerstone, you’ll
hear the Word of God
preached and taught, and
enjoy a relaxed blended
worship.

Cornerstone Church
was born just about 12
years ago and started with
around 20 people. We are
now a family with a weekly
gathering of nearly 300
and we continue to grow.

This is an exciting time
at Cornerstone, and God’s
blessings and Spirit 
are evident.  

Cornerstone’s programs
span the generations of our
family. From youth group
to Wednesday night prayer,
Celebrate Recovery,
women’s and men’s min-
istries, summer Kids and
Youth Camp, vacation
Bible school, and others
Cornerstone’s programs
promote strong fellowship
and a deep reliance on
God’s presence in our
lives—both corporately
and individually.

We love welcoming new
people into our family, so if
you’re new to the area or
just want to see how God is
moving and growing us;
come grow with us.

Senior Pastor: Josh
Easlon

Associate Pastor: to be
determined

Worship service: 10:30
a.m.

Sunday school: 9 a.m.
Youth group: 6 to 

8 p.m. first and third 
Sunday of each month

Celebrate Recov-
ery: 6:30 p.m. Tuesdays

Prayer Fellowship: 6
p.m. Wednesdays

Kids Camp: 
July 6 to 10
New! Glow Run: 9 p.m.
Vacation Bible School
July 20 to 23: 
5 to 8 p.m.
and can be found at:

clarioncornerstone.com/mi
ssions

Web address:
clarioncornerstone.com

Email address: info@
clarioncornerstone.com 

Follow us on Facebook:
facebook.com/Cornerstone
ChurchofClarion/

Instagram: corner-
stonechurchofclarion

Rizer Fireworks gears up for summer fun

Submitted photo.
The Rizer Fireworks team, pictured from left, are: Clifton Rizer, Mary Rizer, Madi-

son Tepke, Christina Tepke, and Jacob Tepke

Submitted article
MARIENVILLE — Riz-

er Fireworks is a family-
owned and run retail busi-
ness that was established
in 1984 by Clifton and
Mary Rizer in Marienville,
Pennsylvania. The couple
opened their second loca-
tion in Shinglehouse,
Pennsylvania in 1997. As
the small company contin-
ued to grow a third loca-
tion was opened in Russell,
Pennsylvania in 2004. The
family has since opened
another location in
DuBois, Pennsylvania in
May of 2022. Rizer Fire-
works has been providing
safe entertainment to our
patrons for 41 years.

The company started
from very humble begin-
nings, with the first year’s
operations being held in a
small rented building in
Vowinckle, Pennsylvania.
This temporary location
was used while the ground
for the permanent store in
Marienville was being
cleared for building. In the
early years of Rizer Fire-
works, the company’s
founders also were supply-
ing 180 Sheetz stores with
sparklers and novelty
items from 1989 – 1995.
From the company’s start
in 1984 until the law
changed in 2017, only out-
of-state residents could
purchase full line fire-
works items; while Penn-
sylvania residents were
restricted to novelties,

fountains, and sparklers.
Throughout the compa-

ny’s 41 years the fireworks
industry has experienced
major growth and change.
Product quality and safety
have continually evolved
and improved with each
passing year. The company
has been affected by the
change in Pennsylvania’s
fireworks law. The original
fireworks law in 1939,
banned the use of aerial
fireworks within Pennsyl-
vania, and was overturned
on October 30, 2017.  This
means that Pennsylvania
residents are now legally
permitted to purchase and
use fireworks within the
state according to the law. 

Rizer Fireworks, in
2017, along with their
storefronts also operated
five tent locations through-
out the area. The company
only did this for the one
year because of another
Pennsylvania law change
that made tents only able
to sell novelties, fountains,
and sparklers from these
temporary structures.

Rizer Fireworks has
worked to establish and
maintain relationships
with the community over
the past 41 years. Mary
Rizer participated in the
entrepreneurial business
leaders’ program at St.
Joesph Elementary school.
The program was designed
to help 5th graders gain a
deeper understanding of
business and its opera-

tions. Rizer Fireworks in
Marienville hosted the stu-
dents for an educational
field trip to the store as
part of the experience. In
2020, with the ongoing
COVID-19 pandemic, Rizer
Fireworks donated fire-
works to North Clarion
Junior/Senior High School
for a special graduation
ceremony to help the
seniors create a special
memory; after missing so
many of the other activities
that should be going on
during senior year were
cancelled or altered to
accommodate COVID safe-
ty protocol.  

This year the company
looks to continue upgrad-
ing its technology with
improvements to both the
website and app, helping
customers better access
product information and
videos. In addition to the
technology boost, the com-
pany is working to become
more active on their social
media platforms; with a
presence on YouTube, Face-
book, and Instagram, fire-
works enthusiasts can con-
nect with the company
easier and enjoy great fire-
works content! Rizer Fire-
works also has started a
gift certificate program,
the best possible gift for
fireworks enthusiasts in
your life!

Additionally, the compa-
ny has made improve-
ments at the Marienville
location by redoing the
floor in our retail space and
pouring new sidewalks out-
side the store. The Shingle-
house location had
improvements to the stores
roof, including new metal
in the fall.  The company’s
Russell location received
an LED sign for promotion-
al advertising in the spring
of 2024. At the DuBois
location improvements
have been made to the
retail space by putting in a
new floor. 

Rizer Fireworks has
been a member of the
National Fireworks Associ-
ation for 25 years and the
Pennsylvania Pyrotechnics
Association for 26 years.
These organizations work
to improve the overall fire-
works industry’s safety
standards, education
access, and fair regulation
at the national and state
levels.

The company is now
owned by Clifton and Mary
Rizer, along with their

daughter Christina (Rizer)
Tepke and her husband,
Jacob. Rizer Fireworks
operates as a summer sea-
sonal business and is open
May – September, with the
option to make appoint-
ments the rest of the year
at any of the four locations.

Rizer Fireworks pro-
vides the public with
access to fireworks prod-
ucts such as: rockets, fire-
crackers, fountains, para-
chutes, roman candles,
mortar sets, and repeater
cakes. High quality prod-
ucts are imported from
China for the best value
and lowest prices. Since
the new tariffs on China,
the overall fireworks
industry has been adapt-
ing to the changing and
ongoing supply chain
issues that have resulted.
Fortunately, the company
had already received over
90% of their inventory for
the 2025 summer season
and does not anticipate the
tariffs to impact con-
sumers this year. Rizer
Fireworks works to place
orders earlier with suppli-
ers to alleviate some of the
economic pressures creat-
ed by the new and ever-
changing tariffs to ensure
that the shelves are filled
with high quality fire-
works for all our cus-
tomers to enjoy! The 2025
season will debut over 30
new items in our stores!

All of us at Rizer Fire-
works are highly anticipat-
ing the summer of 2026, as
the United States will cel-
ebrate its Semiquincenten-
nial, marking the 250th
anniversary of the signing
of the Declaration of Inde-
pendence. “This will be the
biggest Fourth of July Cel-
ebration!” explained
Christina, “everyone will
be going all out with their
celebrations and everyone
at Rizer Fireworks looks
forward to helping families
create lifelong memories
for this very special cele-
bration!”

Rizer Fireworks offers
a large selection of both
ground and aerial display
items, with sizes and
prices to accommodate
every celebration and bud-
get. The company’s friend-
ly and knowledgeable staff
works to help families cre-
ate their own perfect back-
yard experience! “Our staff
treats our customers like
family because that is real-
ly important to us,” stated
Christina, “we want to
help make summer memo-
ries that include fireworks
fun!”

Rizer Fireworks is also
available for professional
display shows for town fes-
tivals, weddings, birth-
days, retirements, gradua-
tions, and other events.
Over the past 41 years the
company has provided

these services for events
such as: the Marienville
Fourth of July Celebration,
Smethport Summer Festi-
val, Horsethief ’s Days in
Knox, Potter County Fair,
St. Mary Church Picnic in
Crown, Girl Scout Camp,
Community Days in Rural
Valley, Mayfest in Fryburg,
and Light Up Night in
Leeper.

Rizer Fireworks is
excited to offer the most
Buy 1, Get 2 Free deals in-
store anywhere! In-store
bonuses also add value to
your shopping experience.
Additional early-bird spe-
cials run through Father’s
Day. For an unforgettable
experience visit Rizer Fire-
works. They are located at
40147 Route 66 in
Marienville and are open
from May to September.
Call 814-316-1183 or visit
www.rizerfireworks.com.
Rizer Fireworks can be
found in the app store; you
can also find them on Face-
book and Instagram.

All of us at Rizer Fire-
works would like to extend
a heartfelt thank you to all
the family, friends, cus-
tomers, businesses, and
colleagues that have sup-
ported us along that way!
Rizer Fireworks is a suc-
cess because of all of you
and we look forward to
continuing to provide safe,
quality backyard enter-
tainment to all of you!■
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