
 
 
 

 City Council 

Agenda Item 

 
 

 
Subject: Approval of a Bid Award for the Petroleum Products and Street Maintenance 

Materials for 2025, Project No. 2427, to Various Contractors and Suppliers at the 
Designated Pricing as Outlined in the Bid Tabulations and Summary of 
Recommended Award. 

Meeting: City Council - Nov 04 2024 

From:  Amanda Mack, City Manager 

 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
Bids were opened on October 16, 2024, for the annual Petroleum Products and Street Maintenance 
Materials for 2025, Project No. 2427. This bid contains several individual products, generally utilized 
for miscellaneous street maintenance operations and materials, the City’s annual fuel pricing, and 
snow and ice control treatments. The following materials were advertised for bid: 
 
1. Hot mix and cold mix asphalt 
2. Pit run gravel, crushed rock (gravel), crushed concrete, pea gravel, deicing sand, dirt, and rip rap 
3. Gasoline & diesel fuel 
4. Salt & calcium chloride 
5. Cutting edges 

 
 
FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS: 
The unit price bids to be awarded are included in the attached Summary of Apparent Low Bidders. 
The budget for these items are accounted for in multiple City Department operational line 
items. This unit price bid award will allow each relevant department to purchase these materials on 
an as-needed basis throughout fiscal year 2025. Each department is responsible for their purchases 
and managing expenditures within the confines of their approved budgets, or as otherwise approved 
by City Council. 

 
 
OVERSIGHT / PROJECT RESPONSIBILITY: 
Heath VonEye, Assistant City Manager/Public Works Director  
Rob Beynon, Street Superintendent 
Caitlyn German, Engineering Technician 

 
 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION / SUGGESTED MOTION: 
Staff recommends approval of the bid award with the following motion: 
  



I move to approve a Bid Award for the Petroleum Products and Street Maintenance Materials for 
2025, Project No. 2427, to Various Contractors and Suppliers at the Designated Pricing as Outlined in 
the Bid Tabulations and Summary of Recommended Award. 

 
 
ATTACHMENT(S): 
 
 
2427 Awards List 
2427 Bid Tabulation 



ASPHALT PRODUCTS SUPPLIER NOTES
Hot Mix Asphalt @ $86.00 per ton Duininck Inc.
Cold Mix Asphalt @ $180.00 per ton Duininck Inc.

ROCK, GRAVEL, DIRT, RIPRAP
Pit Run Gravel @ No Bid per ton Duininck Inc.
Crushed Rock @ $17.00 per ton Duininck Inc.
Crushed Concrete @ $17.00 per ton Duininck Inc.
Pea Gravel @ $18.15 per ton Duininck Inc.
De-Icing Sand (city hauls) @ $18.75 per ton Duininck Inc.
De-Icing Sand (delivered) @ No Bid per ton Duininck Inc.
Fill Dirt No Bid per ton Duininck Inc.
Black Dirt @ $27.00 per ton Duininck Inc.
Riprap @ No Bid per ton Duininck Inc.

GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL - PRICE REDUCTION PER GALLON
Gasoline  

Unleaded Gasoline @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
10% Ethanol Unleaded (87 Octane) @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
10% Ethanol Unleaded (89 Octane) @ No Bid per gal Sioux Valley COOP
E30 Ethanol Blend (89 Octane) @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
E85 Ethanol Blend Unleaded @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
Premium Unleaded (91 Octane) @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP

Diesel Fuel No. 1-D   
1-D, Clear @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
1-D, Dyed @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP

Diesel Fuel No. 2-D   per gal Sioux Valley COOP
2-D, Clear @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
2-D, Dyed @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP

Diesel Fuel 50/50 Blend   
50/50 Blend, Clear @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP

 50/50 Blend, Dyed @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
Bio-Diesel Blend   

Bio-Diesel Blend, Clear @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP
Bio-Diesel Blend, Dyed @ $0.10 per gal Sioux Valley COOP

SALT & CALCIUM CHLORIDE
Rock Salt @ $83.72 per ton Central Salt LLC
Calcium Chloride @ $705.00 per ton Blackstrap Inc.

CUTTING EDGES
One-Way Plows:

1" x 8" x 6' bolt on @ No Bid per EA
1" x 8" x 6' bolt on w/ crbd edge @ No Bid per EA

Motor Grader
3/4" x 8" x 7' double bvl bolt on @ No Bid per EA
5/8" x 8" x 7' double bvl bolt on @ No Bid per EA
5/8" x 8" x 8' double bvl bolt on @ No Bid per EA
3/4" 8" x 4' Str/flt edge w/crbd edge @ No Bid per EA
3/4" 8" x 3' Str/flt edge w/crbd edge @ No Bid per EA

SUMMARY OF APPARENT LOW BIDDERS



Date and Time of Bid Opening:  October 16, 2024 @ 3:00 P.M.

Hot Mix & Cold Mix Asphalt
2024 Prices  % Change

Duininck Inc. Duininck Inc.
P.O. Box 208 408 6th St.

ITEM 408 6th St Prinsburg MN  56281
DESCRIPTION Pringsburg, MN 56281 Ph: 320-978-6011

Fax: 320-978-4978
Bid Security $200 Check $200 Check $200 Check

$400 Bond $400 Bond  

All PRICES ARE PER TON

HOT MIX ASPHALT $86.00 84.50$                                   1.78%

COLD MIX ASPHALT $180.00 180.00$                                 0.00%

Pit Run, Crushed Rock, Crushed Concrete, Pea Gravel, Sand, Dirt, Rip Rap
2024 Prices  % Change

Duininck Inc. Duininck Inc.
P.O. Box 208 408 6th St.

ITEM 408 6th St Prinsburg MN  56281
DESCRIPTION Pringsburg, MN 56281 Ph: 320-978-6011

Fax: 320-978-4978
Bid Security $200 Check $200 Check $200 Check

$400 Bond $400 Bond  
ALL PRICES ARE PER TON

ITEM I - PIT RUN GRAVEL
1,000 tons more or less No Bid $9.00
ITEM II - CRUSHED ROCK (GRAVEL)
1,000 tons more or less $17.00 $16.25 4.62%
ITEM III - CRUSHED CONCRETE
1,000 tons more or less $17.00 $16.25 4.62%
ITEM IV - PEA GRAVEL
1,000 tons more or less $18.15 $14.60 24.32%
ITEM V - DE-ICING SAND  
4,000 tons more or less (City Haul) $18.75 $10.50 78.57%
4,000 tons more or less (Deliver) No Bid $20.15
ITEM VII - DIRT
(a) fill dirt No Bid No Bid
(b)  black dirt $27.00 $26.00 3.85%
ITEM VIII - RIP RAP
100 tons, more or less No Bid

TABULATION OF BIDS
Project 2427

NAME OF BIDDERS

NAME OF BIDDERS

No Bid



Cutting Edges
2024 Prices  % Change

Equipment Blades Inc.
27127 Parklane Dr.

ITEM Sioux Falls SD  57107
DESCRIPTION Ph: 605-336-2730

Fax: 605-336-8241
Bid Security $200 Check $200 Check

$400 Bond $400 Bond
1.  One Way Plows

  
1" X 8" X 6' bolt on, 50 No Bid $193.13
1" X 8" X 6' bolt on w/ carbide insert wear 
edge, 10 No Bid $240.99
2.  Motor Grader
3/4" X 8" X 7' Dbl bevel bolt on, 50 No Bid $149.83
5/8" X 8" X 7' Dbl bevel bolt on, 100 No Bid $123.24
5/8" X 8" X 8' Dbl bevel bolt on, 20 No Bid $146.84
3/4" X 8" X 4' Str/flt edge w/crbd edge,10 No Bid $322.22
3/4" X 8" X 3' Str/flt edge w/crbd edge,10 No Bid $241.04  

 
Combined Total #VALUE! $0.00   

NAME OF BIDDERS



Gasoline and Diesel Fuel
2024 Prices  % Change

Sioux Valley Cooperative Sioux Valley Cooperative
220 10th Street NW 220 10th Street NW

ITEM Watertown, SD  57201 Watertown, SD  57201
DESCRIPTION (605) 886-5829 (605) 886-5829

Fax (605) 886-4995 Fax (605) 886-4995
Bid Security $200 Check $200 Check

$400 Bond $400 Bond
PRICE REDUCTION PER GALLON  

ITEM #1a.  Unleaded Gasoline 87
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
250 gallons or more delivered
ITEM #1b. 10% Ethanol Blend Unlead 87  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
250 gallons or more delivered
ITEM #2.  10% Ethanol Blend Unlead 89
At supplier's pump No Bid No Bid  
250 gallons or more delivered  
ITEM #3. E30 Ethanol Blend Unleaded 89
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
ITEM #4. E85 Ethanol Blend Unleaded 
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
ITEM #5.  Premium Unleaded (91Octane)
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
ITEM #6a.  Diesel Fuel No. 1-D  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
250 gallons or more delivered
ITEM #6b.  Diesel Fuel No. 1-D With Dye  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
250 gallons or more delivered
ITEM #7a.  Diesel Fuel No. 2-D  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
250 gallons or more delivered
ITEM #7b.  Diesel Fuel No. 2-D With Dye  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
250 gallons or more delivered
ITEM #8a.  Diesel Fuel 50/50 Blend  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
ITEM #8b.  Diesel Fuel 50/50 Blend  
At supplier's pump              With Dye $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
ITEM #9a.  Bio-Diesel Blend  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%
ITEM #9b.  Bio-Diesel Blend With Dye  
At supplier's pump $0.100 $0.100 0.00%

NAME OF BIDDERS



Salt and Calcium Chloride
2024 Prices  % Change

Central Salt LLC Blackstrap Inc. Blackstrap Inc.
1420 State Road 14 Box 258 Box 258

ITEM Lyons, KS 67554 Neligh, NE  68756 Neligh, NE  68756
DESCRIPTION Ph: 620-257-5626 Ph:  402-887-5658 Ph:  402-887-5658

Fax:  402-887-5659 Fax:  402-887-5659
Bid Security & Remarks $200 Check $200 Check $200 check

$400 Bond $400 Bond
$83.72 $84.80 $86.44 -3.15%

1000 Tons Rock Salt $/Ton $83,720.00 $84,480.00 $86,440.00
 No Bid $705.00 $695.00 1.44%
15 Tons Calcium Chloride $/Ton No Bid $10,575.00 $10,425.00

NAME OF BIDDERS


	Cover
	2427 Awards List
	2427 Bid Tabulation

