
INDEPENDENT SCHOOL 
DISTRICT 191 

SPECIAL MEETING MINUTES 
AUGUST 28, 2018 

This is a summary of the Burns-
ville-Eagan-Savage Special School 
Board Meeting on Tuesday, August 
28, 2018, with full text available for 
public inspection on the district 
website at www.isd191.org or the 
District Office at 200 West Burns-
ville Parkway, Burnsville, MN.

The meeting was held at the 
Diamondhead Education Center, 
200 W. Burnsville Parkway, Burns-
ville, MN, 55337 and was called 
to order by Chair Schmid at 5:00 
p.m. Board members Alt, Currier, 
VandenBoom, Schatz, Miller, Luth 
and Chair Schmid were present. 
Superintendent Amoroso, admin-
istrators, staff and members of the 
public were also present. Luth led 
the Pledge of Allegiance. 

Recommended actions ap-
proved: agenda and approve for 
the 2019-2020 school year, the 
proposed programming priorities 
and staffing retention protections 
and their qualifying criteria as stat-
ed in the resolution.

The meeting adjourned at 5:05 
p.m. 

All motions carried unanimously 
unless indicated otherwise.
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