

Levin Legal Group, P.C.
1301 Masons Mill Business Park
1800 Byberry Road
Huntingdon Valley, PA 19006

Invoice submitted to:
Manheim Township School District
c/o Robert M. Frankhouser, Jr., Esquire
Hartman Underhill & Brubaker, LLP
221 East Chestnut Street
Lancaster, PA 17602

JUL 15 2015

July 9, 2015

In Reference To: [REDACTED]

Invoice #36090

Professional Services

		Hrs/Rate	Amount
6/9/2015	MIL telephone from Bob Frankhouser	0.20 190.00/hr	38.00
	MIL prepare engagement letter; compose and send email to Bob	NO CHARGE 190.00/hr	
	ASP Conference with Mike re: [REDACTED]; review [REDACTED]	1.80 180.00/hr	324.00
6/10/2015	MIL review email from Bob; compose and send email to Bob	0.10 190.00/hr	19.00
	ASP Review emails from Bob Frankhouser with [REDACTED]; create [REDACTED]	3.10 180.00/hr	558.00
6/11/2015	MIL conference call with Alli and Bob; review email and attachment from Bob	0.40 190.00/hr	76.00
	ASP Conference with Mike Levin; telephone call with Bob Frankhouser and Mike; review and respond to multiple emails from Bob; [REDACTED]	3.10 180.00/hr	558.00
6/12/2015	MIL [REDACTED] review email and attachment from Frankhouser	0.10 190.00/hr	19.00
	ASP Review emails from Mike Levin with letters to [REDACTED] multiple emails with Mike and Bob [REDACTED]	0.90 180.00/hr	162.00

			Hrs/Rate	Amount
6/14/2015	ASP	Review complaints [REDACTED]; conference with Mike Levin	3.40 180.00/hr	612.00
6/15/2015	ASP	Travel to and from [REDACTED]; prepare email to Bob Frankhouser re: schedule	11.40 180.00/hr	2,052.00
6/16/2015	ASP	Emails with Bob Frankhouser; telephone call with Bob; review [REDACTED]; prepare for [REDACTED]	1.50 180.00/hr	270.00
6/17/2015	ASP	Travel to and from [REDACTED]	11.60 180.00/hr	2,088.00
6/18/2015	ASP	Travel to and attend [REDACTED] emails with Bob Frankhouser re: [REDACTED]; telephone call from Bob re: [REDACTED]	5.70 180.00/hr	1,026.00
6/19/2015	ASP	Prepare letter and email to [REDACTED]; review and respond to email from Bob re: contact information; prepare for [REDACTED]	0.80 180.00/hr	144.00
6/20/2015	ASP	Emails with [REDACTED] prepare for [REDACTED]	1.30 180.00/hr	234.00
6/22/2015	ASP	Travel to and from [REDACTED]; review and respond to emails [REDACTED]	11.20 180.00/hr	2,016.00
6/23/2015	ASP	Prepare for call [REDACTED]; telephone call from Bob Frankhouser; review [REDACTED]	1.30 180.00/hr	234.00
	ASP	Prepare for interview [REDACTED]	2.60 180.00/hr	468.00
6/24/2015	ASP	Travel to and from and interview [REDACTED]; emails with Bob; emails with [REDACTED]	7.50 180.00/hr	1,350.00
6/25/2015	ASP	Prepare [REDACTED]; emails with [REDACTED] and Bob	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
6/29/2015	ASP	Prepare for [REDACTED]	2.30 180.00/hr	414.00
6/30/2015	ASP	Travel to and from and attend [REDACTED]	9.60 180.00/hr	1,728.00
For professional services rendered			80.30	\$14,462.00

Additional Charges :

	<u>Amount</u>
6/19/2015 [REDACTED] transcript (held 6/15/15)	1,045.20
6/22/2015 [REDACTED] transcript (held 6/17/15)	495.00
6/23/2015 [REDACTED] transcript (held 6/18/15)	583.00
 Total additional charges	 \$2,123.20
 Total amount of this bill	 \$16,585.20
 Balance due	 \$16,585.20

Levin Legal Group is dedicated to your complete satisfaction. We welcome any thoughts that you may have as to how we may improve our service to you.

Atty/Paralegal Summary		Hours	Rate
Name		0.80	190.00
Michael I. Levin		79.50	180.00
Allison Snyder Petersen			

Levin Legal Group, P.C.
1301 Masons Mill Business Park
1800 Byberry Road
Huntingdon Valley, PA 19006

AUG 19 2015

Invoice submitted to:
Manheim Township School District
c/o Robert M. Frankhouser, Jr., Esquire
Hartman Underhill & Brubaker, LLP
221 East Chestnut Street
Lancaster, PA 17602

August 12, 2015

In Reference To: [REDACTED]

Invoice #36287

Professional Services

		Hrs/Rate	Amount
7/1/2015	ASP Review email from [REDACTED]	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
7/2/2015	ASP Travel to and from and conduct [REDACTED] prepare email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	8.90 180.00/hr	1,602.00
7/3/2015	ASP Conference with Mike Levin	0.20 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	ASP Conference with Michele Mintz re: [REDACTED]	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
7/6/2015	MM [REDACTED]	0.60 180.00/hr	108.00
	ASP Emails with Michele re: [REDACTED] prepare for call with [REDACTED]; prepare emails to [REDACTED]	0.70 180.00/hr	126.00
	ASP Conferences with Michele re: overview of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.80 180.00/hr	144.00
	ASP Review bill	0.10 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
7/7/2015	MM Prepare [REDACTED]	1.50 180.00/hr	270.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/7/2015	ASP Emails with [REDACTED] telephone [REDACTED] conferences with Michele Mintz; prepare emails to Vicki re: status of transcripts; prepare email to Bob re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.90 180.00/hr	342.00
7/8/2015	MM Telephone call to [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]. MM Prepare [REDACTED]. MM Telephone conference with [REDACTED]	0.10 180.00/hr 1.10 180.00/hr 0.40 180.00/hr	18.00 198.00 72.00
ASP	Emails with [REDACTED]; telephone interview with [REDACTED] prepare notes of conversation with [REDACTED]; prepare for interview with [REDACTED]; emails with [REDACTED]; conference with Michele re: [REDACTED]; telephone interview with [REDACTED]	3.40 180.00/hr	612.00
7/9/2015	MM Prepare [REDACTED]. MM Prepare [REDACTED]	0.50 180.00/hr 1.30 180.00/hr	90.00 234.00
7/10/2015	MM Prepare [REDACTED]. ASP Conference with Michele re: [REDACTED]	1.50 180.00/hr 0.20 180.00/hr	270.00 36.00
7/13/2015	MM Prepare [REDACTED]. ASP Emails with Michele, stenographers and Vicki Brill	1.50 180.00/hr 0.20 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE 36.00
7/14/2015	MM Telephone conference with R. Frankhouser re: [REDACTED]. MM Telephone call to [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] MM Prepare [REDACTED]. ASP Review email from Bob Frankhouser	0.10 180.00/hr 0.10 180.00/hr 2.80 180.00/hr 0.10 180.00/hr	18.00 18.00 NO CHARGE 18.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/15/2015	MM	Telephone interview with [REDACTED].	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
	ASP	Emails with stenographers	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
7/17/2015	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	10.10 180.00/hr	1,818.00
7/18/2015	MM	Prepare [REDACTED]	4.80 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
7/19/2015	ASP	Emails with stenographers and Michele	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	10.50 180.00/hr	1,890.00
7/20/2015	ASP	Conference with Michele re: status of [REDACTED]	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
	MM	Prepare additional questions for interview of [REDACTED].	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	0.80 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
7/21/2015	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	8.50 180.00/hr	1,530.00
	ASP	Conference with Michele re: developments; emails with [REDACTED]; telephone call from Bob Frankhouser; emails from Bob re: [REDACTED]	0.80 180.00/hr	144.00
7/22/2015	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	3.50 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	ASP	Prepare for [REDACTED] interview with [REDACTED]	4.40 180.00/hr	792.00
7/23/2015	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	1.50 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	ASP	Prepare for [REDACTED] interview with [REDACTED]; emails with [REDACTED]; Bob Frankhouser; telephone call from Bob; review email from court reporter	1.00 180.00/hr	180.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
7/23/2015	ASP	Prepare email to Michele re: [REDACTED]; telephone call to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; prepare letter to [REDACTED]	0.80 180.00/hr	144.00
7/24/2015	ASP	Emails with [REDACTED]	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
7/26/2015	ASP	Review emails from [REDACTED]	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
7/27/2015	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	5.80 180.00/hr	1,044.00
	ASP	Prepare emails to [REDACTED] re: documents; telephone call to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; telephone call to Bob Frankhouser; emails with [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.90 180.00/hr	162.00
7/28/2015	ASP	Travel to and from and attend [REDACTED] interview of [REDACTED]	6.20 180.00/hr	1,116.00
	MM	Prepare [REDACTED].	5.70 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
7/29/2015	ASP	Telephone call with Bob Frankhouser	1.40 180.00/hr	252.00
7/30/2015	MM	Emails with [REDACTED].	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
	ASP	Conference with Michele re: [REDACTED]; prepare letter and text [REDACTED]; telephone call to [REDACTED]; gather documents for Michele; review and respond to email from [REDACTED]	1.60 180.00/hr	288.00
7/31/2015	MM	Review transcripts to prepare [REDACTED].	4.20 180.00/hr	756.00
	ASP	Multiple emails re: transcripts; review and forward emails from [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
		For professional services rendered	<hr/> 103.50	<hr/> \$14,868.00
		Additional Charges :		
7/13/2015		[REDACTED] transcript (held 6/17/15)		545.80
		[REDACTED] transcript (held 6/24/15)		428.55
7/17/2015		[REDACTED] transcripts (held 7/2/15)		520.55

	<u>Amount</u>
Total additional charges	\$1,494.90
Total amount of this bill	\$16,362.90
Previous balance	\$16,585.20
Accounts receivable transactions	
7/29/2015 Payment - thank you. Check No. 6229	(\$16,585.20)
Total payments and adjustments	(\$16,585.20)
Balance due	\$16,362.90

Levin Legal Group is dedicated to your complete satisfaction. We welcome any thoughts that you may have as to how we may improve our service to you.

Name	Atty/Paralegal Summary	
	Hours	Rate
Michele Mintz	47.60	180.00
Michele Mintz	20.60	0.00
Allison Snyder Petersen	35.00	180.00
Allison Snyder Petersen	0.30	0.00

Levin Legal Group, P.C.
1301 Masons Mill Business Park
1800 Byberry Road
Huntingdon Valley, PA 19006

SEP 14 2015

Invoice submitted to:
Manheim Township School District
c/o Robert M. Frankhouser, Jr., Esquire
Hartman Underhill & Brubaker, LLP
221 East Chestnut Street
Lancaster, PA 17602

September 9, 2015

In Reference To: [REDACTED]

Invoice #36428

Professional Services

			Hrs/Rate	Amount
8/3/2015	MM	Emails with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
	MM	Text messages with [REDACTED].	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
	MM	Review documents provided by [REDACTED] to prepare for [REDACTED].	1.50 180.00/hr	270.00
	MM	Emails from [REDACTED].	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
	ASP	Conference with Michele Mintz re: documents [REDACTED]	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
8/4/2015	MM	Email from [REDACTED].	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
	MM	Review additional documents from [REDACTED].	1.50 180.00/hr	270.00
8/5/2015	MM	Email from R. Frankhouser re: [REDACTED].	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
	ASP	Emails with Bob Frankhouser re: various issues	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
8/8/2015	MM	Email to [REDACTED] re: conference call.	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00

SEP 14 2015

Manheim Township School District

Page 2

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/10/2015	MM	Emails with [REDACTED] re: conference call.	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
	ASP	Review and respond to email from Bob Frankhouser re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
8/11/2015	ASP	Multiple emails with Bob Frankhouser; telephone call to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 180.00/hr	90.00
8/12/2015	MM	Telephone call to [REDACTED] re: conference call.	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
	MM	Email to [REDACTED] re: conference call.	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
	MM	Emails with [REDACTED].	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
	ASP	Telephone call to Bob Frankhouser; conference with Michele	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
	ASP	Review bill	0.10 180.00/hr	NO CHARGE
8/13/2015	ASP	Telephone call to [REDACTED]; prepare email to Bob Frankhouser	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
	MM	Review additional documents provided by [REDACTED]; prepare for [REDACTED].	2.40 180.00/hr	432.00
8/14/2015	MM	Travel and attendance [REDACTED].	10.50 180.00/hr	1,890.00
	ASP	Review email from Bob Frankhouser re: [REDACTED]; telephone call from Michele	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
8/17/2015	MM	Travel and attendance [REDACTED].	10.50 180.00/hr	1,890.00
8/18/2015	MM	Emails with [REDACTED].	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
8/24/2015	ASP	Review and respond to emails from [REDACTED]; conference with Michele re: [REDACTED], documents from [REDACTED]	0.50 180.00/hr	90.00
8/26/2015	MM	Emails with [REDACTED].	0.20 180.00/hr	36.00
	MM	Email from [REDACTED].	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00

SEP 14 2015

Manheim Township School District

Page 3

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/25/2015	MM	Prepare for continued [REDACTED].	1.80 180.00/hr	324.00
	ASP	Conference with Michele re: [REDACTED] supplemental information	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
8/26/2015	MM	Travel and attendance at [REDACTED].	11.60 180.00/hr	2,088.00
	ASP	Telephone call from Michele re: [REDACTED]	0.10 180.00/hr	18.00
8/27/2015	MM	Telephone interview of [REDACTED]	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
	ASP	Conference with Michele re: [REDACTED]	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
8/28/2015	MM	Telephone conferences with R. Frankhouser re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED].	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
	MM	Emails with [REDACTED].	0.50 180.00/hr	90.00
	ASP	Review and respond to email from Bob Frankhouser re: [REDACTED] email; telephone call from Bob; emails with Michele; telephone call from Michele	0.80 180.00/hr	144.00
8/31/2015	MM	Emails from [REDACTED].	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
	MM	Emails with [REDACTED].	0.40 180.00/hr	72.00
	MM	Telephone conference with R. Frankhouser re: [REDACTED].	0.30 180.00/hr	54.00
	ASP	Review emails from Bob Frankhouser; conference with Michele re: [REDACTED]	0.90 180.00/hr	162.00
		For professional services rendered	49.60	\$8,910.00

Additional Charges :

8/4/2015	[REDACTED] transcript (held 7/28/15)	860.50
8/18/2015	[REDACTED] transcript (held 08/14/15)	1,445.60
8/20/2015	[REDACTED] transcript (held 08/17/15)	1,497.72

SEP 14 2015

Manheim Township School District

Page 4

	<u>Amount</u>
Total additional charges	\$3,803.82
Total amount of this bill	\$12,713.82
Previous balance	\$16,362.90
Accounts receivable transactions	
8/31/2015 Payment - thank you. Check No. 6658	(\$16,362.90)
Total payments and adjustments	(\$16,362.90)
Balance due	\$12,713.82

Levin Legal Group is dedicated to your complete satisfaction. We welcome any thoughts that you may have as to how we may improve our service to you.

Name	Atty/Paralegal Summary	
	Hours	Rate
Michele Mintz	44.70	180.00
Allison Snyder Petersen	4.80	180.00
Allison Snyder Petersen	0.10	0.00